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Committee Meetings 
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Future Meetings of the Parliament 

Business Programme agreed by the Parliament on 29 June 2022 

Tuesday 6 September 2022 

2:00 pm Time for Reflection 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

followed by Topical Questions (if selected) 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Committee Announcements 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

followed by Members' Business 

Wednesday 7 September 2022 

2:00 pm Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

2:00 pm Portfolio Questions: Health and Social Care; Social Justice, Housing and Local 
Government 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

followed by Approval of SSIs (if required) 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

followed by Members' Business 

Thursday 8 September 2022 

11:40 am Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

11:40 am General Questions 

12:00 pm First Minister's Questions 

followed by Members' Business 

2:30 pm Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

2:30 pm Portfolio Questions: Constitution, External Affairs and Culture 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

Tuesday 13 September 2022 
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2:00 pm Time for Reflection 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

followed by Topical Questions (if selected) 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Committee Announcements 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

followed by Members' Business 

Wednesday 14 September 2022 

2:00 pm Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

2:00 pm Portfolio Questions: Justice and Veterans; Finance and Economy 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

followed by Approval of SSIs (if required) 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

followed by Members' Business 

Thursday 15 September 2022 

11:40 am Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

11:40 am General Questions 

12:00 pm First Minister's Questions 

followed by Members' Business 

2:30 pm Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

2:30 pm Portfolio Questions: Education and Skills 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

5:00 pm Decision Time



Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Committees | Comataidhean 

 

 
6 Monday 8 August 2022 

 

Future Committee Meetings 

The future business of the Parliament has not yet been agreed to.
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Motions 

Motions and amendments are usually printed the day after lodging. When an amendment is 
lodged, then the original motion will be republished alongside it. 
 
Motions and amendments can be published with symbols: 
 
*    before the number indicates publication for the first time 
*…* around a section of text indicates changes to previously published material  
R   indicates a member has declared a registered interest 
 
The Parliamentary Bureau periodically deletes motions or amendments that are over six weeks old 
and not scheduled for debate. 
 
Questions regarding this section should be directed to the Chamber Desk. 

Members' Business motions that have achieved cross party support 

*S6M-05568 Stephanie Callaghan: 25 Years of the National Autistic Society Scotland: 
Creating a Society that Works for Autistic People—That the Parliament congratulates National 
Autistic Society (NAS) Scotland on the 25th Anniversary of its founding; understands that NAS 
provides a wide range of services and support to many of the 56,000 autistic people living in 
Scotland, including in the Uddingston and Bellshill constituency, as well as to their families; 
welcomes both the variety and ongoing success of these services, which, it understands, include 
post-diagnostic support for children and young people, in-person and online social groups, one-to-
one mentoring, supported living services and an education rights helpline; notes in particular what 
it sees as the success of NAS’ training and employment support programme, Moving Forward+, 
which is funded via the Scottish Government’s CashBack for Communities initiative, in preparing 
hundreds of autistic young people for meaningful employment; applauds the work of NAS 
volunteers across Scotland, whose work through local branches, it believes, is invaluable in 
communities; acknowledges what it sees as the many positive transformations that have been 
made across the country in the last 25 years to move towards a society that works for autistic 
people; recognises what it sees as the benefits of continued constructive engagement as the 
National Care Service develops; acknowledges what it sees as the importance of advocacy 
support to work to promote autistic people’s rights across all services, including schools, further 
education, social security, housing, health and mental health services; welcomes the Scottish 
Government’s commitment to presenting a Learning Disability, Autism, and Neurodiversity Bill to 
this Parliament, including the appointment of an associated Commissioner, and commends the 
National Autistic Society Scotland, Scottish Autism and ENABLE Scotland, for campaigning jointly 
on this important issue. 

Supported by: Rona Mackay*, Jeremy Balfour*, Emma Harper*, David Torrance*, Monica 
Lennon*, Audrey Nicoll*, Paul McLennan*, Foysol Choudhury*, Fulton MacGregor*, Annabelle 
Ewing*, John Mason*, Paul Sweeney*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Bill Kidd*, Mark 
Ruskell*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Sue Webber*, Kaukab Stewart*, Ruth Maguire* 

Other new and altered motions and amendments 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05568
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*S6M-05596 Evelyn Tweed: Congratulating Neil Fachie and Lewis Stewart's Successes at 
Birmingham Commonwealth Games—That the Parliament congratulates Neil Fachie of 
Aberdeen and Lewis Stewart of Killearn on winning a gold medal and a silver medal at the 2022 
Commonwealth Games in Birmingham; praises Neil and Lewis for winning a gold medal in the 
para-sport 1000m time trial B tandem, and a silver medal in the para-sport sprint B tandem; notes 
that Lewis Stewart was Neil Fachie's pilot, and wishes both Neil and Lewis continued success in 
their sporting careers. 

Supported by: David Torrance*, Kenneth Gibson*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jackie Dunbar*, Jeremy 
Balfour*, Bob Doris*, Annabelle Ewing*, Edward Mountain*, Murdo Fraser*, Paul Sweeney*, 
Siobhian Brown*, Kaukab Stewart*, Marie McNair*, Joe FitzPatrick* 

*S6M-05595 Evelyn Tweed: Congratulations to Ross Murdoch on Success at Birmingham 
Commonwealth Games—That the Parliament congratulates Ross Murdoch of Balfron on winning 
three bronze medals at the 2022 Commonwealth Games in Birmingham for the 200m 
breaststroke, 50m breaststroke and 4x100m medley relay; understands that Ross trains at the 
University of Stirling which hosts the National Swimming Academy; notes that Ross has 
announced his retirement from competitive swimming, and wishes him well in his future 
endeavours. 

Supported by: Alexander Stewart*, David Torrance*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jackie Dunbar*, Miles 
Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Bob Doris*, Annabelle Ewing*, Edward Mountain*, Murdo Fraser*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Siobhian Brown*, Kaukab Stewart*, Marie McNair*, Joe FitzPatrick* 

*S6M-05594 Evelyn Tweed: Duncan Scott Success at Birmingham Commonwealth Games 
2022—That the Parliament congratulates Duncan Scott on his incredible successes at the 2022 
Commonwealth Games in Birmingham; commends Duncan on winning gold medals in the 200m 
freestyle and 200m individual medley, and four bronze medals in the 400m individual medley, 
100m freestyle, 4x200m freestyle relay, and 4x100m medley relay; understands that Duncan is 
now Scotland's most decorated Commonwealth athlete of all time after winning 13 medals across 
three Commonwealth Games; further understands that Duncan trains at the University of Stirling, 
which hosts the National Swimming Academy, and wishes Duncan continued success in his 
career. 

Supported by: David Torrance*, Alexander Stewart*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Kenneth Gibson*, 
Jackie Dunbar*, Miles Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Bob Doris*, Annabelle Ewing*, Edward Mountain*, 
Murdo Fraser*, John Mason*, Paul Sweeney*, Siobhian Brown*, Kaukab Stewart*, Joe FitzPatrick* 

*S6M-05593 Jeremy Balfour: Scottish Young Carers Festival—That the Parliament welcomes 
the recent Scottish Young Carers Festival, organised by Carers Trust Scotland; understands that 
this was the first in-person Scottish Young Carers Festival since 2019; further understands that 
there were over 350 young people taking part in a range of different activities over the three-day 
festival; thanks Carers Trust Scotland for its hard work in organising a great event; believes that 
young carers work incredibly hard to look after loved ones; considers that young carers need 
decision makers in Scotland to listen to them and allow their lived experience to inform policy 
going forward, and extends its gratitude to all carers in Scotland for everything that they do for 
vulnerable people in society. 

*S6M-05592 Graeme Dey: Carnoustie’s Eilish McColgan Wins 10,000m Commonwealth Gold 
—That the Parliament congratulates middle- and long-distance runner Eilish McColgan, who grew 
up in Carnoustie, on winning her first gold medal at the Commonwealth Games in Birmingham, 
running a Commonwealth Games record of 30 minutes and 48.60 seconds for Team Scotland in 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05596
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05595
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05594
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05593
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05592
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the 10,000m final; notes that she follows in the footsteps of her mother, Liz, who won the same 
title at the 1986 and 1990 Commonwealth Games in Edinburgh and Auckland, and applauds this 
exceptional family success story; acknowledges that Eilish overcame sickness and injury earlier in 
the year to achieve this win; wishes her continued success going forward, and believes that 
people across Scotland will take pride and inspiration from her achievement. 

Supported by: Monica Lennon*, Fulton MacGregor*, Kenneth Gibson*, Paul McLennan*, Maggie 
Chapman*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, David Torrance*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Stuart McMillan*, 
Miles Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Bob Doris*, Rona Mackay*, Audrey Nicoll*, Annabelle Ewing*, 
Edward Mountain*, Paul Sweeney*, Siobhian Brown*, Kaukab Stewart*, Joe FitzPatrick*, Finlay 
Carson* 

*S6M-05589 Maurice Golden: Congratulations to Eilish McColgan —That the Parliament 
congratulates Eilish McColgan on winning gold in the women’s 10,000m at the 2022 Birmingham 
Commonwealth Games; notes that this is her first Commonwealth Games medal and comes 32 
years after her mother, Liz McColgan, also won a gold medal in the women’s 10,000m at the 1990 
Commonwealth Games in Auckland; understands that Eilish is a two-time European medallist, 
winning a silver medal in the 2018 European Athletics Championships held in Berlin, and a bronze 
medal in the 2017 European Athletics Indoor Championships held in Belgrade; commends Eilish 
for her work on "giving back to track", which aims to encourage children from all backgrounds into 
athletics and lead healthy lifestyles, starting with her local athletic club Dundee Hawkhill Harriers, 
and wishes Eilish continued success on the track as the new reigning Commonwealth Games 
women’s 10,000m champion. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, Kaukab Stewart*, Jeremy Balfour*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Alexander 
Stewart*, Douglas Ross*, Murdo Fraser*, Jamie Greene*, Miles Briggs*, Craig Hoy*, Brian 
Whittle*, Annie Wells*, Jackie Dunbar*, Finlay Carson* 

*S6M-05588 Stuart McMillan: Becky Deveney Pens Her First Book—That the Parliament 
congratulates 20-year-old Becky Deveney, from Inverkip, on penning her first book in a bid to help 
keep kids safe on the roads; notes that the book, titled Lizzy the Lollibug, is about a ladybird 
school patroller and aims to engage children in the topic of road safety; recognises that Becky 
came up with the character of Lizzy the Lollibug 18 months ago and was inspired to put pen to 
paper by her papa who is a member of Greenock Writers’ Club; appreciates that Becky’s school 
friend Haillie McCafferty drew the illustrations for the book; understands that the book is printed by 
Inverclyde-based Love and Humphries Printing Company, and wishes Becky all the best for the 
future. 

Supported by: Alexander Stewart*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jeremy Balfour*, Miles Briggs*, David 
Torrance*, Jackie Dunbar*, Annabelle Ewing*, Paul Sweeney*, Kaukab Stewart* 

*S6M-05587 Liam Kerr: Seven Green Flag Awards for Aberdeen Open Spaces—That the 
Parliament congratulates Hazlehead Park, Seaton Park, Victoria Park, Johnston Gardens, 
Slopefield Allotments, Garthdee Field Allotments and Duthie Park for all achieving a Green Flag 
Award; understands that the Green Flag Award is an international scheme that recognises outdoor 
recreational areas that can demonstrate excellent management and maintenance, proven 
environmental standards that encourage biodiversity, promote positive mental health, enable 
exercise and provide a safe and accessible space for play; recognises what it sees as the 
incredible effort put in by volunteers to maintain these spaces, and wishes all involved the very 
best for the future. 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05589
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Supported by: Craig Hoy*, Douglas Ross*, Jeremy Balfour*, Jackie Dunbar*, Miles Briggs*, 
Sandesh Gulhane*, Russell Findlay*, Alexander Stewart*, Bill Kidd*, Stuart McMillan*, Brian 
Whittle*, Jamie Greene*, Annie Wells*, Edward Mountain*, Paul Sweeney*, Kaukab Stewart*, 
Finlay Carson* 

*S6M-05586 Fulton MacGregor: Glenboig Development Trust's Teresa Aitken Appointed 
Fellow of Cambridge University—That the Parliament congratulates Glenboig Development 
Trust’s operational manager Teresa Aitken on being appointed as a fellow of Cambridge 
University; understands that she will now contribute to the faculty of social innovation via research 
and supporting lectures; believes that her expertise will help both the UK and the international 
community to recover and develop; considers that this is also an achievement for the work ethic of 
Glenboig Development Trust; believes that this appointment will mean both the Glenboig 
Development Trust and Teresa will be an inspiration to future communities and their development, 
and wishes Teresa continued success into the future. 

Supported by: Gillian Mackay*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jeremy Balfour*, Ruth Maguire*, David 
Torrance*, Stuart McMillan*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Paul Sweeney*, Siobhian Brown* 

*S6M-05585 Christine Grahame: Scottish SPCA Pet Aid Initiative —That the Parliament 
welcomes the launch by the Scottish SPCA of its Pet Aid initiative to support people and pets who 
are struggling due to the cost of living crisis; notes that through Pet Aid, it will provide essential 
food supplies for animals through a network of food banks across most of Scotland, with a view to 
keeping pets and people together wherever possible; recognises that this is in the context of calls 
to the Scottish SPCA’s helpline by people looking to give up pets trebling in 2022, a trend that is 
also being reported by other charities such as Edinburgh Dog and Cat Home; understands that 
many people who find themselves in this position don’t want to give up their animal, are very 
distressed, but feel they have no choice; believes that nobody should have to give up their much 
loved pet because they are unable to afford the items they need, and hopes that Pet Aid goes 
some way to preventing this heartbreaking outcome, for the good of both owners and animals. 

Supported by: Kenneth Gibson*, Audrey Nicoll*, Mark Ruskell*, Bill Kidd*, Stephanie Callaghan*, 
Paul McLennan*, Miles Briggs*, Alexander Stewart*, Stuart McMillan*, David Torrance*, Siobhian 
Brown*, Jeremy Balfour*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Emma Harper*, Paul Sweeney*, Sue Webber*, 
Jackie Dunbar*, Kaukab Stewart*, Ruth Maguire*, Finlay Carson* 

*S6M-05584 Mark Ruskell: Launch of the Ian Findlay Path Fund—That the Parliament 
commends the launch of the new Ian Findlay Path Fund, worth £1.5 million, which supports path 
management projects that improve the accessibility and resilience of existing paths between 
homes, community services, active travel routes and public transport facilities or connections; 
notes that the fund is managed by Scotland’s walking charity, Paths for All, and supported by 
Transport Scotland; understands that the fund has been developed as a tribute to Ian Findlay, late 
chief officer at Paths For All; further understands that the fund will enable more people to walk, 
wheel or cycle for their everyday journeys in order to improve air quality, reduce CO2 emissions 
and improve physical health and mental wellbeing; understands that the fund is now accepting 
applications from community groups, development trusts and charities; encourages communities 
looking to improve the accessibility of their local path networks to apply for a share of the fund, 
and wishes the fund and the selected projects every success for the future. 

Supported by: Gillian Mackay*, Jeremy Balfour*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Bill Kidd*, Miles Briggs*, 
Paul McLennan*, Ross Greer*, Bob Doris*, Annabelle Ewing*, Maggie Chapman*, Stuart 
McMillan*, Paul Sweeney*, Dean Lockhart*, Ruth Maguire* 
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*S6M-05583 Fulton MacGregor: Coatbridge Resident Helps Raise over £42,000 through 
Long-distance Cycle—That the Parliament congratulates Coatbridge resident Janet Hancock on 
completing a 300 mile virtual cycle in order to raise money for the food charity Vitamin Angels UK 
and Theodora Children’s Charity; understands that the fundraiser was held by staff from Alliance 
Healthcare who raised over £42,000 for the chosen charities; notes that participants made it their 
goal to cycle a combined distance of 1,000 km; praises Janet’s determination as an injury she 
received meant she could not take part in the actual cycle, but decided to contribute by cycling the 
distance on a static bike, and understands that Janet inspired 16 of her colleagues to exceed the 
target distance by a combined total of 820 miles, which was invaluable for boosting the fundraising 
total. 

Supported by: Stephanie Callaghan*, Jeremy Balfour*, Evelyn Tweed*, Miles Briggs*, David 
Torrance*, Stuart McMillan*, Siobhian Brown*, Annabelle Ewing*, Monica Lennon*, Jackie 
Dunbar* 

*S6M-05582 Audrey Nicoll: The Galloway Hoard: Viking-Age Treasure Comes to Aberdeen—
That the Parliament notes The Galloway Hoard: Viking-Age Treasure special exhibition, taking 
place at Aberdeen Art Gallery from 30 July to 23 October 2022; understands that the hoard, buried 
over 1,000 years ago and discovered in 2014 at Balmaghie, Kirkcudbrightshire, contains over 100 
diverse objects including jewellery, textiles, wool, linen and silk; notes that the hoard was acquired 
by National Museums Scotland following support from the National Heritage Memorial Fund, the 
Art Fund, the Scottish Government and a major public fundraising campaign; further notes that the 
exhibition has free admission and enables people to examine the objects, including hidden details 
found through x-rays, CT scans and 3D modelling, and find out more about the hoard and Vikings; 
commends the efforts of all involved in studying, managing and showcasing the hoard, and 
encourages people in Aberdeen and across the north east to find out more during its stay in the 
city. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, Foysol Choudhury*, Kenneth Gibson*, Miles Briggs*, Stephanie 
Callaghan*, Rona Mackay*, Douglas Lumsden*, David Torrance*, Jeremy Balfour*, Stuart 
McMillan*, Bill Kidd*, Liam Kerr*, Annabelle Ewing*, Edward Mountain*, Siobhian Brown*, Kaukab 
Stewart*, Ruth Maguire* 

*S6M-05580 Alexander Stewart: Jim Warnock from Clackmannanshire Appointed Chairman 
of Royal Highland and Agricultural Society of Scotland—That the Parliament welcomes the 
news that a gentleman from Clackmannanshire, Jim Warnock, has been appointed chairman of 
the Royal Highland and Agricultural Society of Scotland (RHASS); understands that Jim Warnock 
who is managing director of Alloa-based JDWAgri Ltd has been a Stirling area director at RHASS 
since 2010, before being appointed chairman designate in 2020; believes that during his time at 
the society, Mr Warnock from Clackmannan, has served as steward for cattle, sheep, light horse, 
and heavy horse, before being selected as chief steward of the main ring, a position he held for 
five years from 2015 until 2019, and has now been appointed chairman for a two-year term; 
understands that as past chairman of Stirling Young Farmers and past chairman and president of 
Stirling Agricultural Society, Mr Warnock has been an active member of Royal Highland 
Educational Trust (RHET) Forth Valley delivering classroom talks, farm visits and other RHET 
events; considers that the RHASS, which was founded in 1784, supports the very best standards 
in agriculture, forestry, and stewardship of the countryside, in addition to having a rich history of 
encouraging advances in education, science, technology, and craftsmanship over more than two 
hundred years; further considers that the RHASS also promotes the regeneration of rural 
Scotland, as well as the preservation of its poetry, language and music; acknowledges Mr 
Warnock's significant experience of the entire industry; congratulates Mr Warnock on securing the 
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chairmanship, and commends the RHASS on what it considers to be sterling work for the welfare 
of the entire agricultural industry and the communities that support it, whose support they enjoy in 
return. 
 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, Meghan Gallacher*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas 
Lumsden* 

*S6M-05579 Alex Cole-Hamilton: 100 Years of Corstorphine's Scottish Women's Institute —
That the Parliament congratulates the Corstorphine Scottish Women's Institute on its 100 year 
anniversary; understands that the institute began in 1922 and has a long history of service in the 
community, and wishes it well for the future. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney* 

*S6M-05576 Jackie Dunbar: Aberdeen Fertility Centre—That the Parliament congratulates 
Aberdeen Fertility Centre as it merges into NHS Grampian; notes that NHS Grampian and the 
University of Aberdeen have worked in partnership for years; understands that this move will bring 
Aberdeen in line with Scotland’s other fertility centres; notes that Aberdeen Fertility Centre is a 
provider of clinical services to NHS Grampian, Highland, Orkney, Shetland, and to self-funding 
patients; understands that the team helped the first Scottish baby to be born following egg 
donation in 1993 and the first after surgical sperm retrieval in 1996; further understands that the 
Fertility Centre will move into the newly-built Baird Family Centre when it opens in 2024, and 
wishes all staff and patients the best for the future of the centre. 

Supported by: Bill Kidd*, Kenneth Gibson*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jeremy Balfour*, Beatrice 
Wishart*, Miles Briggs*, Paul Sweeney*, Annabelle Ewing*, David Torrance*, Stuart McMillan*, 
Evelyn Tweed*, Audrey Nicoll*, Gillian Martin*, Douglas Lumsden*, Ruth Maguire*, Kaukab 
Stewart* 

*S6M-05575 Maurice Golden: Scottish SPCA Pet Aid Service—That the Parliament welcomes 
the Scottish SPCA Pet Aid service, which it understands is being introduced on 2 August 2022 to 
support those impacted by the cost of living crisis; recognises what it sees as the critical service 
that the Scottish SPCA provides to support people and their pets, particularly those impacted by 
the cost-of-living crisis; understands that the Scottish SPCA expects a greater influx of animals 
into its animal rescue and rehoming centres for reasons such as neglect, abandonment and 
relinquishment, which, it believes, will add to the pressure that their frontline services already feel; 
welcomes that the Scottish SPCA’s Pet Aid programme will provide what it sees as an invaluable 
form of support to pet owners in 12 local authority areas in Scotland, and understands that Pet Aid 
is a pilot project, which the Scottish SPCA is fully committed to expanding to help people and pets 
nationwide. 

Supported by: Craig Hoy*, Murdo Fraser*, Douglas Ross*, Alexander Stewart*, Annie Wells*, Tess 
White*, Miles Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Kenneth Gibson*, Stuart McMillan*, Jamie Greene*, Bill 
Kidd*, Paul Sweeney*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Russell Findlay*, Brian Whittle*, Mark Ruskell*, 
Sharon Dowey*, Christine Grahame*, Meghan Gallacher*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas 
Lumsden*, Finlay Carson* 

*S6M-05574 David Torrance: Olly Mackay Walks 96 Miles to Raise Money for 115th Scout 
Group—That the Parliament commends 8-year-old Olly Mackay on raising £1,100 for the 115th 
scout group in Kirkcaldy; notes that Olly and his dad Lee walked 96 miles from Milngavie to Fort 
William; celebrates his energy and motivation to keep going, completing between 10 and 15 miles 
each day during the heatwave in July 2022; understands that during their walk Olly carried a 
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charity tin to collect donations from people he met on his way to Fort William, and wishes him all 
the best for his plan to tackle Ben Nevis. R 

Supported by: Rona Mackay*, Bill Kidd*, Emma Harper*, Miles Briggs*, Stuart McMillan*, Jackie 
Dunbar*, Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Edward Mountain*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Evelyn Tweed*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

*S6M-05572 Liam Kerr: The Peterhead Producer Market—That the Parliament welcomes back 
the Peterhead Producer Market, providing a wide range of the best local produce; notes that the 
market takes place on the first Saturday of each month; understands that the market is a project of 
Rediscover Peterhead, which also subsidises each stall price to increase the accessibility of the 
market to producers; applauds this initiative and the work that it is doing to support local 
businesses and increase the purchasing of local produce,and hopes that the market is a great 
success. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, Tess White*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Alexander Stewart*, Miles 
Briggs*, Craig Hoy*, Brian Whittle*, Douglas Ross*, Stuart McMillan*, Edward Mountain*, Jeremy 
Balfour*, Jamie Greene*, Bill Kidd*, Annie Wells*, Sharon Dowey*, Meghan Gallacher*, Sue 
Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden*, Russell Findlay*, Finlay Carson* 

*S6M-05571 Liam Kerr: Camphill School Receive £100,000 for New Residential Home 
Project—That the Parliament congratulates Camphill School on receiving a £100,000 boost 
towards its £3 million project to build a new residential home; notes that the generous funding was 
from the Wolfson Foundation; understands that Camphill School currently supports 95 people, and 
provides residential support to children and young people with learning disabilities and complex 
additional support needs; further understands that the project to build a new residential home is 
part of a 10-year, £10 million vision to create three new residential homes, increase workshop 
provision and launch a sustainable social enterprise, which, it believes, will allow Camphill School 
to support more people who are not accessing services, and hopes that the project is a great 
success. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, Alexander Stewart*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Tess White*, Miles 
Briggs*, Craig Hoy*, Brian Whittle*, Douglas Ross*, Stuart McMillan*, Edward Mountain*, Jeremy 
Balfour*, Jamie Greene*, Bill Kidd*, Annie Wells*, Audrey Nicoll*, Sharon Dowey*, Pam Duncan-
Glancy*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden*, Russell Findlay*, Finlay Carson* 

*S6M-05570 Alex Cole-Hamilton:  Congratulating the Lionesses on Winning Euro 2022—
That the Parliament congratulates the England Women’s Football team on becoming the new 
European Champions; notes that it comes 56 years after the only other previous major trophy won 
by a men's or women's England senior team; considers that the Lionesses' victory is a hugely 
significant and historic moment in British sporting history, and celebrates the wonderfully positive 
impact, it believes, their victory will have on women’s football in the UK. 

Supported by: Murdo Fraser*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Foysol Choudhury*, Fulton MacGregor*, Miles 
Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Carol Mochan*, Stuart McMillan*, Liz Smith*, David Torrance*, Bill Kidd*, 
Edward Mountain*, Paul Sweeney*, Christine Grahame*, Meghan Gallacher*, Sue Webber*, 
Douglas Lumsden*, Kaukab Stewart* 

*S6M-05569 Ross Greer: Passing of Sally Beaumont—That the Parliament notes with sadness 
the passing of Sally Beaumont; understands that, over a period of eight years, Sally welcomed 25 
asylum seekers into her home and helped to inspire others to do the same; further understands 
that as a refugee herself, Sally was evacuated to Canada during the Second World War and that 
in her later years, after returning to Glasgow, was keen to help others who found themselves in 
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similar situations; is grateful to Sally for becoming one of Positive Action in Housing's longest 
standing volunteers and for her involvement in establishing the Room for Refugees programme 
run by the charity, which, it understands, has sheltered more than 4,000 refugees; notes Sally's 
wider commitment to peace and justice; believes that this was exemplified by her membership of 
the Campaign for Nuclear Disarmament since the 1950s, her arrest for protesting outside Faslane 
nuclear base and her involvement in the Iona Community, and is thankful for Sally's many 
contributions to help make Scotland and the world a more welcoming place 

Supported by: Gillian Mackay*, Annabelle Ewing*, Evelyn Tweed*, Kenneth Gibson*, Bill Kidd*, 
Maggie Chapman*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Fulton MacGregor*, Stuart McMillan*, Paul Sweeney*, 
Kaukab Stewart*, Ruth Maguire* 

*S6M-05522 David Torrance: Natalie Galloway Continues Musical Career Success with New 
York Shows—That the Parliament recognises accomplished Scottish actress, singer and 
songwriter, Natalie Galloway from Kirkcaldy, also known as NatiDreddd; notes her prestigious feat 
of securing a recording gig at the world famous Abbey Road Studios in London when she was only 
11 years old; understands that she is also a popular online personality with 1.7 million followers on 
the social media site, TikTok; acknowledges what it sees as her dedication to engaging with and 
sharing her infectious personality with people from all backgrounds across the world; 
congratulates her for projecting what it sees as a positive representation of her Scottish culture 
through musical talent, and wishes her every success in continuing her musical journey, and the 
best of luck with her upcoming shows in New York. 

Supported by: Miles Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Audrey Nicoll*, Murdo Fraser*, 
Alexander Stewart*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Bill Kidd*, Emma Harper*, Foysol Choudhury*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

*S6M-05513 Liam Kerr: Opening of Brae Café —That the Parliament welcomes the opening of 
Brae, a new café and lifestyle store opening in Chapelton, next to Stonehaven; notes that it will be 
offering local produce and items from the menu in its lifestyle store; understands that Brae is being 
run by Dale and Jodie Barbour, who are also the owners of Breer Pie Co; notes what it sees as 
the importance of supporting local business and buying local produce, and hopes that Brae is a 
great success. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, Tess White*, Alexander Stewart*, Craig Hoy*, Jeremy Balfour*, 
Douglas Ross*, Miles Briggs*, Annie Wells*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Jamie Greene*, Edward 
Mountain*, Pam Gosal*, Russell Findlay*, Brian Whittle*, Sharon Dowey*, Meghan Gallacher*, 
Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden*, Finlay Carson* 

*S6M-05485 Karen Adam: Deveronvale Community Football Club, Health and Social 
Benefits—That the Parliament recognises what it sees as the innovative work of Deveronvale 
Community FC; understands that the UEFA GROW Social Return on Investment Report 
Deveronvale Community FC - Valuation Report 2021 highlights the positive economic, health and 
social benefits that the football club provides to the local community; further understands from the 
report that, looking at the club's activities through a wellbeing lens, rather than a purely economic 
lens, Deveronvale Community FC’s overall yearly contribution to the local economy equates to 
£1.75 million per year; commends Deveronvale Community Club for what it sees as this innovative 
approach, embracing a wellbeing economic model, and thanks all volunteers and staff whose 
contribution and efforts bring so much to the local community economically and socially.   

Supported by: Annabelle Ewing*, Kenneth Gibson*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jeremy Balfour*, 
Jackie Dunbar*, David Torrance*, Stuart McMillan*, Miles Briggs*, Emma Harper*, Siobhian 
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Brown*, Bill Kidd*, Fulton MacGregor*, Edward Mountain*, Maggie Chapman*, Paul Sweeney*, 
Gillian Martin*, Douglas Lumsden*, Liam Kerr*, Kaukab Stewart* 

*S6M-05461 Finlay Carson: Lifeboat Volunteers Receive Queen's Platinum Jubilee Medals 
for Long Service—That the Parliament congratulates members of Port William’s volunteer 
lifeboat, PIRSAC, who were presented with the Queen’s Platinum Jubilee medals after completing 
five or more years service; notes that recipients included George MacKenzie, who recently 
received his MBE at an investiture at Windsor Castle from HRH The Prince of Wales, Alex Oxley, 
Helen Oxley, Gavin Lockhart, Andy Murray, Kevin Howe, Peter Kendal and Stewart Gerrish; 
acknowledges the work carried out by the organisation, who, it understands, for more than 40 
years, has carried out rescues and responded to shouts for help from the Mull of Galloway to 
Barrowhead, Wigtown to Gatehouse of Fleet as well as Luce Bay, and saved more than 400 
persons in the process; recognises what it sees as the commitment and the resilience of the 
people in Port William in campaigning and fund-raising tirelessly to have an inshore lifeboat 
available locally to assist those in need; understands that they saved five people in recent weeks, 
including a leisure boat and one jet ski who were recovered to dry land, and wishes all PIRSAC 
crew members a safe journey in the months ahead. 

Supported by: Brian Whittle*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Alexander Stewart*, Pam Gosal*, Miles Briggs*, 
Bill Kidd*, Jeremy Balfour*, Douglas Ross*, Jamie Greene*, Martin Whitfield*, Stuart McMillan*, 
Edward Mountain*, Emma Harper*, Craig Hoy*, Paul Sweeney*, Tess White*, Russell Findlay*, 
Clare Adamson*, Liam Kerr*, Meghan Gallacher*, Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, 
Douglas Lumsden*, Ruth Maguire* 

*S6M-05426 Sharon Dowey: New Charity Support Group Opens in Ayr—That the Parliament 
recognises what it sees as the incredible work of Ayr’s Stacey Wheeldon; understands that Stacey 
has set up a charity support group, Childhood Abuse Support Team, to support survivors of 
childhood abuse and provide a safe space for those who have experienced childhood trauma to 
talk; believes that Stacey has set up this group following her own traumatic experience, providing 
people the space they need to be heard and start their healing process; understands that, on 8 
July 2022, Stacey opened a local office and safe space in Ayr where survivors can book in for an 
appointment; commends Stacey on her positive work, on the back of a difficult time working to 
support fellow survivors, and wishes her all the best going forward.  

Supported by: Alexander Stewart, Brian Whittle, Siobhian Brown, Stuart McMillan, Karen Adam, 
Miles Briggs, Bill Kidd, Pam Gosal, Douglas Ross, Annie Wells, Jeremy Balfour, Edward 
Mountain, Tess White, Finlay Carson, Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

Motions and amendments which have attracted additional support 

S6M-05578 Patrick Harvie: Scottish Social Housing Charter: November 2022 (SG/2022/146) 
(lodged on 02 August 2022) 

New Support: Shona Robison*, Michael Matheson* 

S6M-05567 Edward Mountain: Lochinver Royal National Lifeboat Institution Raises £6,800 
During Annual Gala Day (lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Tess White*, Alexander Stewart*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Pam Gosal*, Miles Briggs*, 
Jamie Halcro Johnston*, Annie Wells*, Jamie Greene*, Jeremy Balfour*, Brian Whittle*, Colin 
Beattie*, Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Finlay Carson*, Clare Adamson*, Liam Kerr*, Meghan 
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Gallacher*, Alex Cole-Hamilton*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden*, Ruth 
Maguire* 

S6M-05566 Pauline McNeill: Huge Energy Company Profits Recorded (lodged on 29 July 
2022) 

New Support: Liam McArthur*, Foysol Choudhury*, Jackie Baillie*, Alex Rowley*, Stuart McMillan*, 
James Dornan*, Daniel Johnson*, Colin Smyth*, Christine Grahame*, Clare Adamson*, Alex Cole-
Hamilton* 

S6M-05565 Elena Whitham: Cumnock Juniors Football Club Teams with Release Ayrshire 
(lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Colin Beattie*, Pam Gosal*, Audrey Nicoll*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare 
Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Meghan Gallacher* 

S6M-05564 Liam Kerr: Replenish Opens New Shop in Chapelton (lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Jamie Halcro Johnston*, Sharon Dowey*, Meghan Gallacher*, Miles Briggs*, Jamie 
Greene*, Tess White*, Foysol Choudhury*, Annie Wells*, Alexander Stewart*, Sandesh Gulhane*, 
Bill Kidd*, Craig Hoy*, Douglas Ross*, Jeremy Balfour*, Edward Mountain*, Russell Findlay*, Brian 
Whittle*, Stuart McMillan*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden*, Finlay Carson* 

S6M-05563 Pam Gosal: Republic of India 76th Independence Day (lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Jamie Halcro Johnston*, Sharon Dowey*, Clare Adamson*, Liam Kerr*, Meghan 
Gallacher*, Brian Whittle*, Alexander Stewart*, Jeremy Balfour*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Douglas 
Ross*, Murdo Fraser*, Miles Briggs*, Jamie Greene*, Craig Hoy*, John Mason*, Dean Lockhart*, 
Douglas Lumsden*, Stuart McMillan*, Russell Findlay*, Edward Mountain*, Ruth Maguire*, Finlay 
Carson* 

S6M-05562 Pam Gosal: Republic of Pakistan 76th Independence Day (lodged on 29 July 
2022) 

New Support: Jamie Halcro Johnston*, Sharon Dowey*, Clare Adamson*, Liam Kerr*, Meghan 
Gallacher*, Alexander Stewart*, Bill Kidd*, Annie Wells*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Jeremy Balfour*, 
Murdo Fraser*, Craig Hoy*, Jamie Greene*, Miles Briggs*, Fulton MacGregor*, Douglas Ross*, 
Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Stuart McMillan*, Edward Mountain*, Brian Whittle*, Dean Lockhart*, 
Douglas Lumsden*, Russell Findlay*, Ruth Maguire*, Finlay Carson* 

S6M-05561 Graeme Dey: Late Arbroath Carer’s Family Raises £2,000 for Roxburghe House 
(lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Alexander Stewart*, Sharon Dowey*, Audrey Nicoll*, David Torrance*, 
Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Edward Mountain*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05560 David Torrance: The Gillian Parsons Memorial Golf Day (lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Edward Mountain*, Evelyn Tweed*, 
Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05559 Joe FitzPatrick: Team Dundee at the 2022 Commonwealth Games (lodged on 29 
July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Audrey Nicoll*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, 
Evelyn Tweed*, Ruth Maguire* 
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S6M-05558 Jamie Halcro Johnston: Supporting Scotland at the 2022 Commonwealth 
Games (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Jackie Baillie*, Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Stuart McMillan*, Foysol 
Choudhury*, Clare Adamson*, Meghan Gallacher*, Ruth Maguire*, Evelyn Tweed*, Sue Webber*, 
Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05557 Jackie Baillie: Craighelen Lawn Tennis and Squash Club is Club of the Year 
(lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Foysol Choudhury*, Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05556 Jackie Baillie: Helensburgh’s Margaret Rose School of Dance Success in 
Canada (lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Foysol Choudhury*, Douglas Lumsden*, Kaukab 
Stewart* 

S6M-05555 Stephanie Callaghan: NHS Lanarkshire Consultant in Dental Public Health 
Inaugurated as New President of British Association for the Study of Community Dentistry 
(lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Audrey Nicoll*, Sharon Dowey*, David Torrance*, Annabelle Ewing*, 
Jackie Dunbar*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Mackay*, Gillian 
Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05554 Edward Mountain:  Alness Play Scheme and The Field Host Series of Events for 
the Community (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Jamie Halcro Johnston*, Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare 
Adamson*, Meghan Gallacher*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden*, Ruth 
Maguire* 

S6M-05553 Stuart McMillan: Fight Bladder Cancer (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Clare Adamson*, Monica Lennon*, Edward Mountain*, Jeremy 
Balfour*, Tess White*, Annabelle Ewing*, Bill Kidd*, Miles Briggs*, Annie Wells*, Evelyn Tweed*, 
David Torrance*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Audrey Nicoll*, Marie McNair*, Gillian Martin*, Sue 
Webber* 

S6M-05552 Jim Fairlie: Crieff Hydro Awarded Family Business of the Year 2022 (lodged on 
28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Audrey Nicoll*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, 
Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05551 Jim Fairlie: Crowdfunding Efforts to Celebrate the Work of Henry Anderson 
(lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, 
Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05550 Douglas Lumsden: Eurovision Song Contest 2023 (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart* 
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S6M-05549 Clare Adamson: Cessation Champion Lisa O'Neill (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, 
Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05548 Pam Gosal: McMonagles Fish and Chips Boat Clydebank Wins Best Restaurant 
Takeaway Award (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden*, Ruth 
Maguire* 

S6M-05547 Clare Adamson: Major Angus Steele MBE  (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Evelyn Tweed*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05546 Clare Adamson: Roseann Quigley Big Afternoon Tea for Breast Cancer Now 
(lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Evelyn Tweed*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05545 Clare Adamson: Motherwell Under-17s Foyle Cup Winners (lodged on 28 July 
2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Evelyn Tweed*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05544 David Torrance: Ewan Hastie Wins Coveted Mark McKergow Prize from Royal 
Conservatoire of Scotland (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, 
Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05543 Sandesh Gulhane: University of Glasgow Students Win Climate Satellite Design 
Competition (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Foysol Choudhury*, Clare Adamson*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas 
Lumsden* 

S6M-05542 David Torrance: Dysart Sailing Club Celebrates 55th Anniversary (lodged on 28 
July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, 
Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05541 Gordon MacDonald: Wester Hailes Arts for Leisure and Education (WHALE Arts 
Agency) 30th Anniversary (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Sue 
Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05540 Stephanie Callaghan: Bothwell Scarecrow Festival (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, 
Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05539 Pam Gosal: Swaran (Judy) Chowdhury Receives British Empire Medal for 
Charity Work (lodged on 29 July 2022) 
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New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Liam Kerr*, 
Meghan Gallacher*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05538 Alexander Burnett: Andrew McRae Completes Financial Diploma at 21 (lodged 
on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas 
Lumsden* 

S6M-05537 Alexander Burnett: Balmoral and Candacraig Estates Receive Prestigious 
Accreditation (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas 
Lumsden* 

S6M-05536 Alexander Burnett: Aboyne Highland Games Supports Local Groups  (lodged on 
28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas 
Lumsden* 

S6M-05535 Stephanie Callaghan: Lanarkshire Larder Awarded £5,000 funding from the 
Regional Food Fund (RFF) (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05534 Bob Doris: Delivering on Thrombectomy Services and Improving Stroke Care 
(lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Katy Clark*, Evelyn Tweed*, Sue 
Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05533 Jackie Dunbar: Eurovision 2023 (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Clare Adamson*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05531 Alexander Stewart: Disabled Golf Week (Scotland) 2022 (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05530 Paul McLennan: Haddington's New Siege Commemoration Garden (lodged on 27 
July 2022) 

New Support: Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed* 

S6M-05529 Siobhian Brown: Yes We Khan (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Evelyn Tweed* 

S6M-05528 Colin Beattie: Rosewell Farmers’ Market Receive £4,589 Grant from The 
Regional Food Fund (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05527 Douglas Lumsden: Rooftop Garden at Trinity Shopping Centre (lodged on 27 
July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber* 
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S6M-05526 Douglas Ross: 25th Anniversary of Speyfest (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Jamie Halcro Johnston*, Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05525 Elena Whitham: Scottish Preloved Baby Box for Ukraine, Volunteer Group   
(lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Clare Adamson*, Mark Ruskell*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05524 Monica Lennon: Scottish Youth Parliament Motion for Dedicated and Tailored 
Mental Health Services for Care Experienced People (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Martin Whitfield*, Jeremy Balfour*, Foysol Choudhury*, Alexander Stewart*, Carol 
Mochan*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05523 David Torrance: YMCA Continues Inspiring Active Kids Summer Programme  
(lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Kenneth Gibson*, Miles Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Audrey Nicoll*, 
Stephanie Callaghan*, Bill Kidd*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05521 Gordon MacDonald: Saughton Park and Spylaw Park Nominated for Favourite 
Park Award (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05520 Gordon MacDonald: Edinburgh Voted Best City in the World to Visit (lodged on 
27 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Christine Grahame*, Alex Cole-Hamilton*, Clare 
Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05519 Stuart McMillan: Promoting Active Travel and Climate Action in Inverclyde 
(lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Clare Adamson*, Bill Kidd*, Jackie Dunbar*, Foysol Choudhury*, Stephanie 
Callaghan*, Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, David Torrance*, Mark Ruskell*, Evelyn Tweed*, 
Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05518 Jackie Baillie: Helensburgh and Lomond Carers win Excellence for Carers 
Award (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05517 Stuart McMillan: River Clyde Homes Wins Customer Service Award (lodged on 
27 July 2022) 

New Support: Jeremy Balfour*, Miles Briggs*, Annabelle Ewing*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Emma 
Harper*, David Torrance*, Bill Kidd*, Clare Adamson*, Jackie Dunbar*, Edward Mountain*, Evelyn 
Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05516 Clare Adamson: Joe O'Raw MBE, the Craigneuk Historian  (lodged on 27 July 
2022) 

New Support: Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 
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S6M-05515 Marie McNair: Dalmuir Barber Wins Best New Barber Shop at Scotland’s 
Business Awards 2022 (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed* 

S6M-05514 Marie McNair: Clydebank’s Golden Jubilee Wins MOD Gold Award (lodged on 27 
July 2022) 

New Support: Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed* 

S6M-05512 Stuart McMillan: Fiona Dempster Success at Amazon Everywoman in Transport 
and Logistics Awards (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Jeremy Balfour*, Stephanie Callaghan*, David Torrance*, Miles Briggs*, Jackie 
Dunbar*, Audrey Nicoll*, Emma Harper*, Annabelle Ewing*, Bill Kidd*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn 
Tweed* 

S6M-05511 Stuart McMillan: Greenock Royal Air Force Club Celebrates 75th Anniversary 
(lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05510 Stuart McMillan: Kip Marina Awarded Five Gold Anchors (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05509 Liam McArthur: 25th Anniversary of Birsay Heritage Trust (lodged on 27 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Kenneth Gibson*, Edward Mountain*, Douglas Ross*, Beatrice 
Wishart*, Rachael Hamilton*, Jeremy Balfour*, Martin Whitfield*, Annabelle Ewing*, Miles Briggs*, 
Bill Kidd*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05508 Daniel Johnson: Scottish Retail Consortium Raises £16.6 million for Charity 
(lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05507 Annabelle Ewing: Niall Williams Fundraises £25,444 for Fife Heath Charity 
(lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05506 Craig Hoy: Protecting the Future of Scotland’s Historic Environment (lodged on 
28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Russell Findlay*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart* 

S6M-05505 Stephen Kerr: Candied Ice Cream Parlour of the Year 2022 (lodged on 26 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05504 Liam Kerr: Mannofield Church and Inchgarth Community Centre New Foodbank 
and Support Project Coordinator (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05515
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05514
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05512
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05511
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05510
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05509
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05508
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05507
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05506
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05505
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05504


Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Motions | Gluasadan 

 

 
22 Monday 8 August 2022 

 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Douglas Ross*, Finlay Carson*, Jamie Greene*, Jeremy Balfour*, 
Alexander Stewart*, Brian Whittle*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Miles Briggs*, Pam Gosal*, Annie Wells*, 
Tess White*, Russell Findlay*, Craig Hoy*, Bill Kidd*, Sue Webber*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05503 Michelle Thomson: Candied Scoops Ice Cream Parlour of the Year at Scottish 
Takeaway Awards 2022 (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05501 Alexander Stewart: Samaritans, The Big Listen 2022 (lodged on 21 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05500 Michelle Thomson: Port of Grangemouth Secures Scottish Express Service for 
Exports (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05499 Dean Lockhart: Bikes Without Barriers (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Evelyn Tweed*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05498 Liam McArthur: Stromness Shopping Week 2022 (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Jeremy Balfour*, Martin Whitfield*, Douglas Ross*, Miles Briggs*, 
Annabelle Ewing*, Audrey Nicoll*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Bill Kidd*, Stuart McMillan*, Edward 
Mountain*, Alex Cole-Hamilton*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05497 Donald Cameron: UK Funding to Deliver Low Carbon Aviation Solution for the 
Highlands and Islands (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Jamie Halcro Johnston*, Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber*, Douglas Lumsden*, 
Jeremy Balfour*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Miles Briggs*, Craig Hoy*, Douglas Ross*, Russell Findlay*, 
Alexander Stewart*, Brian Whittle*, Jackson Carlaw*, Jamie Greene*, Annie Wells*, Edward 
Mountain*, Murdo Fraser*, Finlay Carson* 

S6M-05496 Stephanie Callaghan: Uddingston Business Woman Nominated for Small 
Entrepreneur of the Year (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05495 Douglas Lumsden: New Wonderland Festival in Aberdeen (lodged on 26 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05493 Liam Kerr: The Society Awards 2022 (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Brian Whittle*, Douglas Ross*, Finlay Carson*, Jamie Greene*, 
Jeremy Balfour*, Alexander Stewart*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Miles Briggs*, Pam Gosal*, Tess 
White*, Stuart McMillan*, Russell Findlay*, Craig Hoy*, Bill Kidd*, Edward Mountain*, Douglas 
Lumsden* 

S6M-05492 Evelyn Tweed: Mugdock Country Park Nominated for Fields in Trust UK's 
Favourite Parks Award (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Marie McNair*, Gillian Martin* 
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S6M-05491 David Torrance: 20th Anniversary of the Fife-based International Fire and 
Rescue Association Charity (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Stewart*, Kenneth Gibson*, Miles Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle 
Ewing*, Audrey Nicoll*, Murdo Fraser*, Craig Hoy*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Bill Kidd*, Emma 
Harper*, Mark Ruskell*, Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05490 Foysol Choudhury: Scottish Muslim Funeral Services (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05489 Stephanie Callaghan: National Campaign Launched to Support Young Women 
Facing Abuse in Their Intimate Relationships (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Annabelle Ewing*, Mark Ruskell*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05488 Alasdair Allan: Scottish Nature Photographer of the Year 2021 (lodged on 25 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Annabelle Ewing*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05487 Rachael Hamilton: Wilton Lodge Park Nominated in the Fields in Trust UK’s 
Favourite Parks Award 2022 (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Russell Findlay*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05486 Stephanie Callaghan: Scottish Scientists Play Integral Role in the Development 
of the James Webb Space Telescope (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Annabelle Ewing*, Evelyn Tweed*, Maggie Chapman*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05484 Willie Rennie: Pilgrim Care St Andrews (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05482 Jackie Dunbar: North East Sensory Services Achieve Gold Standard 
Accreditation for Third Time (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Annabelle Ewing*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05481 Russell Findlay: Glasgow and Aberdeen Airports Lead Medical Distribution 
Drone Project with NHS Scotland (lodged on 26 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05479 Emma Roddick: Celebrating 200 Years of The Inverness Highland Games 
(lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05477 Martin Whitfield: Paving the Way, Interim Report (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Daniel Johnson*, Fulton MacGregor*, Beatrice Wishart*, Alex Cole-Hamilton*, Sue 
Webber* 

S6M-05476 Michelle Thomson: McKechnie School of Dance and Performing Arts' Success 
at Dance World Cup 2022 (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 
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S6M-05475 Murdo Fraser: Junior Macnab Challenge Success at GWCT Scottish Game Fair 
(lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Russell Findlay*, Sue Webber*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05474 Emma Harper: Success of StoryTrails in Dumfries Town Centre  (lodged on 25 
July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Foysol Choudhury*, Stuart McMillan*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05473 Emma Harper: Invaluable Contribution of The Usual Place, Dumfries  (lodged on 
22 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05471 Jackson Carlaw: Dr Veronikis Contract for Mesh Survivors (lodged on 26 July 
2022) 

New Support: Jackie Baillie*, Russell Findlay*, Sue Webber*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05470 Maurice Golden: Congratulating Chauffeurs of Carnoustie on 25 Years of 
Business (lodged on 22 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05468 David Torrance: Celebrating the Life of The Cottage Family Centre Volunteer, 
Tracey Rankin (lodged on 22 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05467 Russell Findlay: The Inaugural Renfrew Pipe Band Competition (lodged on 20 
July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05466 David Torrance: Kirkcaldy Charity Clued Up Helping to Support Young People 
Affected by Substance Abuse (lodged on 22 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05465 David Torrance: Kirkcaldy and District Men's Shed Moves to New Base in Town 
(lodged on 22 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05463 Michelle Thomson: Asda Foundation Grants for Falkirk East Constituency 
Projects (lodged on 22 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Stuart McMillan*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05460 Alexander Burnett: 24-Hour Fishing Event Raises £22,000 for the River Dee 
Trust (lodged on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05459 Clare Adamson: Teeny Tiny Totz Fundraising for Safari Park Trip (lodged on 20 
July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 
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S6M-05458 Clare Adamson: Charity@Home and Resourceful Community Volunteers Joint 
Efforts (lodged on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05457 Clare Adamson: New Age Fitness Fundraiser for Les Hoey MBE DreamMaker 
Foundation (lodged on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05456 Clare Adamson: Rachel Cringles at U21 European Taekwondo Championships 
(lodged on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05455 Clare Adamson: Tony Moore Hair Success at Scottish Business Awards (lodged 
on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05454 Clare Adamson: All About U Success at Scottish Business Awards 2022 (lodged 
on 22 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05453 Clare Adamson: Gas Safety Week 2022, The Hidden Dangers (lodged on 28 July 
2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Foysol Choudhury*, Stuart McMillan*, Christine 
Grahame*, Monica Lennon*, Paul McLennan*, David Torrance*, Alexander Stewart*, Mark 
Ruskell*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05452 Alexander Stewart: Give a Dog a Bone Founder Receives the Pride of Scotland 
Community Hero Award (lodged on 25 July 2022) 

New Support: Russell Findlay*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05451 Alexander Stewart: Asda Foundation Grants Across Fife (lodged on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05449 Michael Marra: World Karate Championships Return to Dundee (lodged on 19 
July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05448 Brian Whittle: Asda Kilmarnock Supports Local Events (lodged on 19 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05447 Colin Beattie: One Dalkeith Receives a £7,500 Spaces and Places Grant from the 
Asda Foundation (lodged on 19 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05446 Liz Smith: Junior Open Champion Connor Graham (lodged on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 
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S6M-05445 Annabelle Ewing: John Thomson Cardenden CSC Raise £4686 For Cardenden 
Youthwork Group (lodged on 19 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05443 David Torrance: Burntisland Harbour Access Trust Gains Successful 
Application for Future Community Interest Purchase for Historic Harbour (lodged on 19 July 
2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05442 David Torrance: Kirkcaldy Acoustic Club Returns After Two-year Hiatus (lodged 
on 19 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05441 David Torrance: Kinghorn RNLI Set to Hold First Open Day Since 2019 (lodged 
on 19 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05438 Edward Mountain: Imogen Boddy, John o' Groats to Land's End (lodged on 28 
July 2022) 

New Support: Jamie Halcro Johnston*, Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas 
Lumsden* 

S6M-05436 Elena Whitham: East Ayrshire Council Catering Staff (lodged on 19 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05435 Elena Whitham: Heroic Actions by East Ayrshire Council Employee (lodged on 
19 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05432 Sharon Dowey: Ayrshire Charge Nurse Shortlisted for Prestigious UK Award 
(lodged on 19 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05431 Sharon Dowey: Hero Joiner Saves Life (lodged on 19 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05430 Sharon Dowey: Ayrshire Stalwart Honoured with Special Accolade (lodged on 19 
July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05429 Sharon Dowey: Ayr Rotary Club Welcomes New President (lodged on 19 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05427 Sharon Dowey: Troon Mum Launches Hopeful Debut Novel (lodged on 15 July 
2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Douglas Lumsden* 
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S6M-05425 Emma Harper: Sam Heughan Receives Honorary Doctorate From the RCS 
(lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05424 Fulton MacGregor: REACH Advocacy Continues to Empower People With 
Problem Substance Use (lodged on 29 July 2022) 

New Support: Stuart McMillan*, Clare Adamson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05423 Alexander Stewart: "Better Safe than Tumour" Campaign Launched by The 
Brain Tumour Charity (lodged on 21 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05422 Stephanie Callaghan: Athlete Shona Girdwood from Bellshill Sets Incredible 
Half Ironman Time (lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05421 Stephanie Callaghan: Bothwell Hair Salon Wins Business Award (lodged on 15 
July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05420 Siobhian Brown: Stewart Travel Agency, Prestwick Celebrates 50 years (lodged 
on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05418 Stuart McMillan: Port Glasgow Zero Waste Pantry Open for Business (lodged on 
15 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05417 Stuart McMillan: Callum Boyd, Inverclyde Voluntary Council of Social Services 
(lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05416 Stuart McMillan: Linda Wilkie Retires After 30 Years in Education (lodged on 15 
July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05415 Stuart McMillan: Fort Matilda Tennis Club Celebrates 100th Anniversary (lodged 
on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05414 Joe FitzPatrick: Kanzen Karate at the WUKF World Karate Championships 2022 
(lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05413 Jeremy Balfour: Stories of Hope: Addiction Recovery (lodged on 28 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Sue Webber*, Dean Lockhart*, Douglas Lumsden* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05425
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05424
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05420
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S6M-05412 Stuart McMillan: Wemyss Bay Holiday Park receive Traveller’s Choice Award 
(lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05411 Stuart McMillan: Beverley Addison Appointed RugbyForce Young Ambassador  
(lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05410 Stuart McMillan: Gourock Boys’ Brigade Members Receive Queen’s Badge 
(lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05409 Audrey Nicoll: Charity Golf Day Raises £12,000 for CFINE  (lodged on 15 July 
2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05408 Pam Gosal: Loch Lomond Lifeboat (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05407 Siobhian Brown: Frances Carson, Muirhead Tenants and Residents Association 
(lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05406 Stephanie Callaghan: Claire Anderson Receives the Bill Wood Community 
Award   (lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05405 Jackson Carlaw: Eastwood Groups Benefit from ASDA Foundation Local Grants 
(lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05404 Jackson Carlaw: Recognising the Success of East Renfrewshire’s All Stars 
Netball Club (lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05402 Alasdair Allan: Janet MacLean Retires from Barra Airport after 38 Years (lodged 
on 18 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05401 Christine Grahame: Galas and Ridings Return (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05400 Audrey Nicoll: Man Chat, Scotland’s Champions Awards Nominee (lodged on 13 
July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05412
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05411
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05400


Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Motions | Gluasadan 

 

 
29 Monday 8 August 2022 

 

S6M-05399 Alexander Burnett: Pat Emslie Retires After 44 Years at The Gordon Schools 
(lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05397 Stephanie Callaghan: David Hunter Wins the Stuart Gemmel Outstanding 
Achievement Award in the Building Engineering Services Association (BESA) for Scotland 
Awards 2022  (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05396 Joe FitzPatrick: Dundee Living Wage Action Group Success at Living Wage 
Foundation Champion Awards (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05395 Alasdair Allan: Epilepsy Consortium Scotland Report: Epilepsy Specialist Nurse 
Services During the COVID-19 Pandemic (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05394 Natalie Don: Re-dedication of Renfrew War Memorial (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05392 Sue Webber: Twinning Partnerships for Scottish and Ukrainian Universities 
(lodged on 15 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05391 Liam Kerr: Greyhope Bay Series of Workshops with Deemouth Artist Studios   
(lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05389 Marie McNair: Clydebank Pupils Grow Produce and Gain Skills and Experience 
(lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05388 Annie Wells: Southside Forest School Fifth in Scotland to be Recognised by 
National Body (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05387 Annie Wells: Vibrant Mural Brings Splash of Colour to City Centre Lane (lodged 
on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05386 Annie Wells: Glasgow Football Club Becomes SFA Licensed Thanks to Fans 
Fundraising Efforts (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05385 Siobhian Brown: Professor Sathish Srinivasan (lodged on 18 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05399
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05397
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S6M-05384 Alasdair Allan: Scottish Gaelic and the 150th Anniversary of the Education 
(Scotland) Act 1872 (lodged on 21 July 2022) 

New Support: Emma Harper*, Mark Ruskell*, Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05383 Murdo Fraser: Meikleour Arms wins AA Best Guest Accommodation of the Year 
Scotland Award (lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05382 Liam McArthur: Deerness Distillery Win Gold at Global Gin Masters Awards 
2022 (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05381 Karen Adam: Buckie Ladies FC (lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05380 Sharon Dowey: Ayrshire Photographer Celebrates 100th birthday (lodged on 12 
July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05379 Sharon Dowey: Ayrshire’s Shopping Experience Named Shoppers Café of the 
Year (lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05378 Sharon Dowey: Ayrshire Family Raise Funds for Mental Health in Memory of Ayr 
Dad (lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05377 Sharon Dowey: Troon Charity Boss Honoured with Pride of Scotland Award 
(lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05376 Sharon Dowey: Troon’s Great Gran Toasts Birthday Milestone (lodged on 12 July 
2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05375 Sharon Dowey: Troon’s Pétanque Club Donates Funds to Ayrshire Hospice 
(lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05374 David Torrance: Kirkcaldy’s Revolution Barber Shop Wins 5 Star Barbers of the 
Year at the Scottish Beauty Industry Awards (lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05373 Paul O'Kane: Cardwell Garden Centre Celebrates its 60th Birthday (lodged on 12 
July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05384
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05383
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05382
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S6M-05372 Jackie Baillie: Congratulating Chivas Staff in Dumbarton for Volunteering 
During Responsib'All Day  (lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05370 Annie Wells: Glasgow Nurse Shortlisted for Patient’s Choice Award at the Royal 
College of Nursing Annual Nursing Awards (lodged on 13 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05369 Annie Wells: Reverend Takes Office as the New Moderator of the Presbytery of 
Glasgow (lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05367 Colin Beattie: MYPAS Awarded £116,400 From The Henry Smith Charity (lodged 
on 11 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05366 Liam Kerr: The Port of Aberdeen Welcomes its First Commercial Vessel to the 
New South Harbour   (lodged on 11 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05365 Stephanie Callaghan: North Lanarkshire Entrepreneur Announced as Great 
British Entrepreneur Awards 2022 Finalist (lodged on 11 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05358 Jackie Dunbar: Aberdeen City Council Tackles Homelessness with New 
Initiative (lodged on 11 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett*, Douglas Lumsden*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05357 Annabelle Ewing: Joanna Kerr Publishes First Book  (lodged on 11 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05356 Liam Kerr: Live Life Aberdeenshire’s Summer Reading  (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05355 Annabelle Ewing: Crossgates Gala 2022 (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05354 Jackie Baillie: Congratulating Braehead Primary on 50 Years (lodged on 08 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05353 Evelyn Tweed: Congratulates Brown Bear Barbershop and Gregor Brown on 
Being Named SHABA 2022 Finalists (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05352 Evelyn Tweed: Congratulates Caffe Pompei, Stirling, for Winning Best Loved 
Cafe of the Year Central Award (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05372
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05370
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05353
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05352


Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Motions | Gluasadan 

 

 
32 Monday 8 August 2022 

 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05351 Evelyn Tweed: Congratulates Jintz Express on Winning Espresso Bar of the 
Year at the Scottish Cafe Awards 2022 (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05350 Evelyn Tweed: Congratulates Old Bank Restaurant on Winning Restaurant Cafe 
of the Year at the Scottish Cafe Awards 2022 (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05349 Liam Kerr: John Gibson, Isobel Gibson and John Gallacher Land’s End to John 
O’Groats Challenge  (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05348 Liam Kerr: Cash For Kids Charity Football Match (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05347 Ruth Maguire: Scottish Beach Awards  (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05346 Ruth Maguire: George Paton, Best Hotel General Manager  (lodged on 08 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05345 Ruth Maguire: National Pocket Garden Competition  (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05343 Foysol Choudhury: Asian Catering Federation Networking Dinner (lodged on 07 
July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05342 Siobhian Brown: Team Heart Hues, Belmont Academy, Ayr  (lodged on 07 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05341 Stephanie Callaghan: Bellshill Young Musicians to Perform at TRNSMT (lodged 
on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05340 Gillian Martin: Recognition of Annual Co-op Fortnight  (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05339 Emma Roddick: Recognising the Alness and Invergordon Emergency 
Community Rescue Group  (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05351
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S6M-05338 Evelyn Tweed: Congratulates Millie Boo Smith on Qualifying for the RDA 
National Championships (lodged on 08 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05337 Stuart McMillan: Julie Macintosh Retires from Early Years After 40 Years (lodged 
on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05336 Stuart McMillan: Morton in the Community’s Breakfast and a Blether (lodged on 
07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05335 Stuart McMillan: Inverclyde Continues to Provide Fresh, Local and Sustainable 
Dishes to School Pupils (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05334 Stuart McMillan: My Kitchen Success at Scottish Hospitality Awards (lodged on 
07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05333 Fulton MacGregor: Amber Sylvia Edwards, Coatbridge, Makes West End Debut 
(lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05332 Brian Whittle: Businesses from Carluke and Forth - Finalists in the 2022 
Lanarkshire Business Awards (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05331 Brian Whittle: R&W Scott of Carluke Named Finalist in the 2022 Lanarkshire 
Business Awards (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05328 Jackie Baillie: Paddle Steamer Waverley Marks 75 Years Serving the Clyde 
Coast (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05327 Monica Lennon: Congratulating the Scotmid Co-operative Menopause Café  
(lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Jeremy Balfour*, Foysol Choudhury*, Alexander Stewart*, Carol 
Mochan*, Stuart McMillan*, Bill Kidd*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Miles Briggs*, Sue Webber*, Ruth 
Maguire* 

S6M-05326 Michelle Thomson: 50 Years of Polmont Playgroup (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05322 Tess White:  Scottish Rugby Launches Women and Girls’ Strategy 2022-2026 
(lodged on 07 July 2022) 
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05331
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05328
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05327
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05326
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05322
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New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05321 Meghan Gallacher: Lanarkshire Health Board Encourages Women to Take 
Smear Tests  (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber* 

S6M-05320 Meghan Gallacher: Dalziel High School Awards St Andrew’s Hospice Following 
Fundraiser  (lodged on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05319 Meghan Gallacher: Digital Health Firm Aiming to Double Workforce  (lodged on 
07 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber* 

S6M-05316 Meghan Gallacher: UK on Brink of Animal Welfare Crisis Claim Charities (lodged 
on 07 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05311 Kenneth Gibson: Daisy McNamara Crowned Scotland’s Young Orienteer of the 
Year (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Sharon Dowey*, Stuart McMillan*, Gillian Martin*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05310 Siobhian Brown: Louise Russell, Give a Dog a Bone  (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05308 Marie McNair: Grand Opening of The Big Disability Group’s New Hub (lodged on 
12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05306 Jackie Baillie: Helensburgh’s Riva Boutique Hotel Wins Prize at the Scottish 
Hospitality Awards (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05305 Jackie Baillie: Loch Lomond Arms Hotel Named Best Wedding Venue and 
Scoops Best Hotel Team (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05303 Stuart McMillan: ICE Allstars Win Gold at the Scottish Regional Championships 
(lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05302 Clare Adamson: The Terrace Café, Wishaw, Wins at Scottish Café Awards 
(lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05301 Evelyn Tweed: Ardoch Burn Crossing, Doune Receives Commendation at 
Scottish Design Awards 2022 (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05321
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05320
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05319
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05311
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05310
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05308
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05306
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05305
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05303
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05302
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05301
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New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05300 Rhoda Grant: Lewis Community Windfarm Project Listed in Top 100 Social 
Enterprise Businesses in the UK (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05299 Marie McNair: Milngavie FC Under-13s Win SYFA Central Regional Cup (lodged 
on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05297 Pauline McNeill: Music Venue Trust Project Own Our Venues (lodged on 06 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05296 Stephen Kerr: Braes High School, Most Improved School in Scotland (lodged on 
05 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05295 Michelle Thomson: Grangemouth Clinic Wins Hair Loss Clinic of the Year at 
Scottish Beauty Industry Awards 2022 (lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05294 Michelle Thomson: Reddingmuirhead Pit Disaster Memorial Receives SUEZ 
Communities Trust Funding (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05293 Stephanie Callaghan: Uddingston Project Manager Wins the BESA Group's HNC 
& HND Apprentice of the Year (lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05292 Stephen Kerr: A Potato With More Vitamin C Than a Lemon (lodged on 27 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sue Webber*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05291 Gillian Martin: The Chocolate Bar Named Cafe of the Year in North Scotland 
(lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05290 Gillian Martin: The Kilted Frog Named Deli of the Year in North Scotland (lodged 
on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05289 Gillian Martin: Dreamy Goat Coffee Co. Best Coffee House in North Scotland 
(lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05300
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05299
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05292
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S6M-05288 Gillian Martin: Delgatie Castle Wins at Scottish Cafe Awards (lodged on 05 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05287 Graeme Dey: Angus Friends Raise £7,000 for Local Mental Health Charity  
(lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05286 Annie Wells: St Mungo's Primary Pupils Deliver Care Packs for Glasgow Royal 
Infirmary Patients (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05284 Annie Wells: Scottish Cafe Awards 2022 (lodged on 06 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05283 Paul O'Kane: Mourning the Attack on LGBT+ Community in Oslo  (lodged on 07 
July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05282 Paul O'Kane: Bipolar Scotland Launches Beyond Diagnosis Service  (lodged on 
06 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05280 Clare Adamson: North Lanarkshire Hub: Excellence in Professional Learning 
Award (lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05279 Douglas Lumsden: Aberdeen Selected to Host World Energy Council Summit 
(lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05278 Willie Rennie: St Andrews Aquarium Welcomes New Seal Pup (lodged on 05 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05277 Marie McNair: Young Bankie Wins Pride of Scotland Award (lodged on 06 July 
2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05276 Pam Gosal: Erin Burnett, 12-Year-Old Bearsden Runner, Sets Record Running 
Time (lodged on 12 July 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Sue Webber*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05275 Pam Gosal: Chris Johnstone, Aged 67, Partner at Bearsden Architects Dallman 
Johnstone, Completes the 2022 Edition of the Highland Trail 550 (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05288
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05287
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S6M-05274 Stephanie Callaghan: Holy Cross High School Pupils Take on Hill Climb 
Challenge for Charity (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05272 Alexander Burnett: GP Cycles 1,118 miles for Charity (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Craig Hoy* 

S6M-05271 Paul McLennan: Black Agnes Festival  (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05268 Ariane Burgess: Shetland Gay Bird Club (lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05267 Ariane Burgess: Culduthel Community Woods (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05266 Rachael Hamilton: Sammi Kinghorn Awarded MBE for Services to Disability 
Sport in the Queen’s Birthday Honours (lodged on 05 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05265 Collette Stevenson: East Kilbride Young Farmers, Success at the Royal 
Highland Show (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05263 Richard Leonard: Importance of Accurate Wages: Asda (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05262 Ruth Maguire: Royal Voluntary Service Award  (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05261 Ruth Maguire: Irvine's Auld Brig Take on Goatfell (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05260 Ruth Maguire: Theresa Potter Charity Tournament (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05259 Ruth Maguire: Luscious LoX, Irvine  (lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05251 Kaukab Stewart: Celebrating 100 years of Women in Law (lodged on 01 July 
2022) 

New Support: Mark Ruskell* 

S6M-05247 David Torrance: Kirkcaldy Company, PeachyKeen, Wins Third Place at 
Ljubljana Smart Pedal Pitch 2022 (lodged on 01 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05274
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05272
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05260
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S6M-05241 Edward Mountain: Cairn Medical Practice Raises Money for Three Highland 
Charities (lodged on 01 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05238 Kenneth Gibson: Saltcoats’ Motherland Spice Wins Team of the Year at Scottish 
Curry Awards (lodged on 01 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05234 Kaukab Stewart: Independent Commission of Inquiry into Asylum Provision in 
Scotland (lodged on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Gillian Martin* 

S6M-05232 Jackie Dunbar: Benefit of the ABZ Propeller Fund to Aberdeen and 
Aberdeenshire  (lodged on 01 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05230 Jim Fairlie: Strathearn Cheese Company, Comrie – Champion Cheesemakers 
(lodged on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05229 Jim Fairlie: Wild Hearth Bakery, Comrie – Supreme Champion Breads  (lodged 
on 04 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05218 Donald Cameron: British Empire Medal for Kenneth Thomson (lodged on 30 June 
2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05216 Kaukab Stewart: Open University Support Package for Ukrainian Students and 
Refugees Arriving in Scotland (lodged on 30 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05215 Graeme Dey: Newtyle Author Wins Sir Walter Scott Prize (lodged on 30 June 
2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05214 Pam Duncan-Glancy: Glasgow and Eurovision 2023 (lodged on 20 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-05213 Craig Hoy: Congratulations to Gill Last on Her Retirement from the Ridge 
Charity in Dunbar (lodged on 30 June 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05212 Pam Gosal: Braehead Primary Dumbarton Celebrates 50th Anniversary (lodged 
on 30 June 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Ruth Maguire* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05241
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05238
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S6M-05211 Liam Kerr: 60th Anniversary of Peterhead Scottish Week (lodged on 30 June 
2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05208 Kenneth Gibson: Congratulations to Moldova and Ukraine on Becoming EU 
Candidate Members (lodged on 30 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05192 Clare Adamson: Wishaw Wycombe Under-14 Girls Lift the Regional League Cup 
(lodged on 30 June 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05191 Clare Adamson: Orchard Nursery's Breastfeeding Friendly Accreditation (lodged 
on 30 June 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire*, Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05190 Gillian Mackay: Moray Primary Wins National Competition (lodged on 30 June 
2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05189 Gillian Mackay: Bo’ness Fair Returns with all its Traditions (lodged on 30 June 
2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05188 Gillian Mackay: Grangemouth Children's Day Queen is Crowned  (lodged on 30 
June 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05183 Michelle Thomson: Braes High School Recognised as Most Improved in The 
Times Scotland High School League Table 2022 (lodged on 30 June 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05182 Kenneth Gibson: Russia Must Take Responsibility for MH17 Mass Murder 
(lodged on 01 July 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05169 Liam Kerr: Peterhead Prison Museum Receives TripAdvisor Travellers’ Choice 
Award 2022 (lodged on 29 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05163 Liam Kerr: Big Noise Torry’s 7th Birthday Concert (lodged on 30 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05134 Audrey Nicoll: Nuart Aberdeen 2022 (lodged on 28 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05211
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05208
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S6M-05132 Audrey Nicoll: Robert Gordon University Ranked Top Modern University for 
Graduate Prospects (lodged on 29 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05130 Monica Lennon: Stonehouse EcoFestival  (lodged on 28 June 2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05118 Mercedes Villalba: ISDS Risks to Climate Action (lodged on 29 June 2022) 

New Support: Jackie Baillie*, Fiona Hyslop*, Daniel Johnson* 

S6M-05116 Paul Sweeney: 22nd Scottish Refugees Festival (lodged on 28 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05112 Paul Sweeney: GMB Scotland and Apple Glasgow Workers Apply to be a 
Voluntary Union Organisation (lodged on 28 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05108 Miles Briggs: Cervical Screening Awareness Week (lodged on 23 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05088 Annie Wells: National Audit of Fracture Liaison Services (lodged on 27 July 2022) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Douglas Lumsden* 

S6M-05085 Alexander Burnett: Banchory Academy Achieves Garden School Status (lodged 
on 27 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05084 Alexander Burnett: Morrisons Foundation Supports Mid Deeside Community 
Trust (lodged on 27 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05083 Alexander Burnett: Banchory Rotary Club Celebrates 50th Anniversary (lodged 
on 27 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05081 Emma Roddick: Inverness Teenager is Fastest in Scotland (lodged on 27 June 
2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-05076 Liam Kerr: North East of Scotland Music Festival (lodged on 24 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05072 Emma Roddick: Corey Rizza and Team Scotland Make History at GB Junior and 
Youth Three Nations Championships (lodged on 24 June 2022) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-05132
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S6M-05068 Stephanie Callaghan: New Scots Graduate from Leadership Programme (lodged 
on 24 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05064 Clare Adamson: International Women in Engineering Day (lodged on 24 June 
2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05063 Clare Adamson: Learning Disability Week 2022 (lodged on 24 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05062 Clare Adamson: World Drowning Prevention Day (lodged on 24 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05058 Jackie Dunbar: Dyce Academy Achieves Green Flag Award (lodged on 24 June 
2022) 

New Support: Ruth Maguire* 

S6M-05047 Tess White: Forfar Stags Win the CSS Invitational Cup (lodged on 27 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05041 Paul O'Kane: Restraint Reduction Scotland (lodged on 23 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05033 Christine Grahame: World Elder Abuse Awareness Day (lodged on 15 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-05030 Collette Stevenson: Congratulations to St Leonard’s Primary 6 Pupils, Euroquiz 
Finalists 2022  (lodged on 23 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04993 Siobhian Brown: Ayr Pipe Band Society  (lodged on 23 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04992 Siobhian Brown: Madison Crane and Jack Simpson, Dalmilling Primary, Ayr 
(lodged on 23 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04982 Alexander Burnett: "Enjoy Alford and Donside" App Launch (lodged on 23 June 
2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04980 Paul McLennan: Close the Gap’s New Think Business Think Equality  (lodged on 
22 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 
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S6M-04968 Audrey Nicoll: Net Zero Technology Centre Awards 12 Start-ups with £100,000 
(lodged on 22 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04959 Kaukab Stewart: One Community Scotland Receives Funding to Support Young 
New Scots in Glasgow (lodged on 21 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04958 Natalie Don: Remembering the Paisley Witch Trials (lodged on 22 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04956 Evelyn Tweed: Stirling Schools Successes in First Minister's Reading Challenge 
Awards 2022 (lodged on 21 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04946 Liam Kerr: Gray’s School of Art Degree Show (lodged on 17 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04937 Maurice Golden: Congratulations to DD8 Music (lodged on 17 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04936 David Torrance: 2022 TPAS Scotland’s National Good Practice Awards (lodged 
on 20 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04934 Jenni Minto: Dunoon Grammar School Wins Gaelic Education Award (lodged on 
20 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04933 Paul Sweeney: The Executive Shaving Company Becomes Scotland’s Newest 
Employee-owned Business  (lodged on 17 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04932 Marie McNair: Clydebank Asbestos Group's 30th Anniversary (lodged on 17 June 
2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04929 Siobhian Brown: John Mark Brown, Ayr (lodged on 17 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04925 Pam Duncan-Glancy: Juvenile Idiopathic Arthritis (JIA) Awareness Week 2022  
(lodged on 10 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04918 David Torrance: 2022 Green Apple Environment Excellence Awards (lodged on 
17 June 2022) 
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New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04914 Sharon Dowey: Girvan Academy Pupil Set to Help Plan the Next Mars Mission 
(lodged on 17 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04907 Tess White: Aberdeen Asda Workers Save Life on Shopfloor (lodged on 17 June 
2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04906 Alex Cole-Hamilton: Cystic Fibrosis Week 2022 (lodged on 14 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04900 Karen Adam: Scotland's Beach Awards (lodged on 17 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04899 Bob Doris: Crescendo's Community Musical Workshops (lodged on 17 June 
2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04896 Alexander Stewart: Cystic Fibrosis Week 2022 (lodged on 14 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04889 Alexander Burnett: Centenary Celebration of Victory Hall, Aboyne (lodged on 17 
June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04878 Paul McLennan: Publication of "How we Meet the Mental Health Needs of All 
Scots" (lodged on 16 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04867 Tess White: Hollie Davidson Becomes First Female Referee for a Men's Six 
Nations Side in a Test Match (lodged on 17 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04866 Tess White: Montrose FC Women Win Scottish Women's Championship North 
League (lodged on 16 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04865 Tess White: Northern Lights Cricket Team Wins Debut Women's Premier 
League Match (lodged on 16 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04857 Foysol Choudhury: Lorne Primary School Achieves LGBT Charter Silver Award 
(lodged on 16 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 
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S6M-04834 Russell Findlay: Scottish Artists’ Art for Ukraine Charity Auction (lodged on 15 
June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04832 Fulton MacGregor:  Congenital Diaphragmatic Hernia Awareness Month (lodged 
on 15 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04826 Donald Cameron: North Uist Distillery Co. to Establish New Distillery in 
Benbecula (lodged on 15 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04811 Karen Adam: Amity Fish Company Win FSB Award (lodged on 14 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04806 Alexander Burnett: Aberdeenshire Athletes Run World Record 106 Marathons in 
106 Days for Charity (lodged on 14 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04805 Jeremy Balfour: Welcoming the SRUC Opening a New Vet School (lodged on 14 
June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04801 Marie McNair: Clydebank’s Golden Friendships Raise Thousands with Walk and 
Roll Event (lodged on 13 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04794 Stephanie Callaghan: Drowning Prevention Week (lodged on 13 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04766 Monica Lennon: Andrea Bradley Elected as EIS General Secretary  (lodged on 15 
June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04759 Colin Beattie: Dalkeith Girls Raise £700 for the Red Cross Ukraine Appeal  
(lodged on 10 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04739 Emma Harper: LGBTQ+ Pride Month 2022 (lodged on 10 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04686 Graeme Dey: Carnoustie’s Olivia Blackburn Wins Prince’s Trust Young 
Achiever Award  (lodged on 15 June 2022) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-04220 Paul McLennan: Haddington's Svetlana, The Cheese Lady, is Awarded Best in 
Scotland (lodged on 17 May 2022) 
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New Support: Maggie Chapman*
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Written Questions 

Questions in which a member has indicated a declarable interest are marked with an "R". 

Written questions lodged from 01 August 2022 to 05 August 2022 

S6W-09846 Douglas Lumsden: To ask the Scottish Government how much businesses in (a) 
Aberdeen City and (b) Aberdeenshire have saved on non-domestic rates as a result of transitional 
relief in each year since 2015. 
S6W-10097 Willie Rennie: To ask the Scottish Government what investigative steps regarding 
the Police Scotland and Crown Office and Procurator Fiscal Service's investigation into the alleged 
use of Scottish airports by CIA rendition flights, not including filing a request to the United States 
Senate for the unredacted report, have been taken over the last 10 years. 
S6W-10098 Willie Rennie: To ask the Scottish Government whether Police Scotland (a) has 
asked for mutual aid from United States police authorities and (b) had access to UK intelligence 
reports or other relevant political files, as part of its investigation into the alleged use of Scottish 
airports by CIA rendition flights. 
S6W-10099 Willie Rennie: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide a breakdown 
of the type and level of resources that have been allocated over the last decade to the Police 
Scotland and Crown Office and Procurator Fiscal Service's investigation into the alleged use of 
Scottish airports by CIA rendition flights. 
S6W-10106 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government how many category (a) purple, 
(b) red, (c) amber and (d) yellow ambulance call-outs took more than (i) 8, (ii) 10, (iii) 15, (iv) 20, 
(v) 30, (vi) 60 and (vii)120 minutes to arrive at the incident in each NHS board area in each (A) of 
the last three calendar years and (B) month in 2022 to date. 
S6W-10113 Liz Smith: To ask the Scottish Government what action it is taking to reduce any 
impact on patients in NHS (a) Tayside and (b) Fife, in light of the reported rising number of 
unscheduled closures of community pharmacies.  
S6W-10115 Liz Smith: To ask the Scottish Government, in light of the reported unscheduled 
closures of community pharmacies, what discussions it has had with (a) pharmacists and (b) 
pharmacy associations since 1 January 2022 regarding any concerns expressed by pharmacists 
on this issue.  
S6W-10116 Pauline McNeill: To ask the Scottish Government what meetings (a) it has had 
recently (b) are planned with COSLA to explore all options available regarding the funding by local 
authorities of any pay increases. 
S6W-10117 Pauline McNeill: To ask the Scottish Government what its position is on whether a 
summit between unions and COSLA could be held to facilitate further discussions on potential pay 
increases for public sector workers 
S6W-10118 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government how many public electric vehicle (EV) 
charging points were installed in the North East region between 1 June 2021 and 31 May 2022, 
broken down by Scottish Parliament constituency. 
S6W-10119 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government how many homes have benefitted from 
the Social Housing Net Zero Heat Fund as of 30 July 2022, and what the average cost per 
property is. 
S6W-10120 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government what it anticipates the impact would be 
on (a) the cost of constructing new buildings and (b) the subsequent sale price to the purchaser of 
the final building, of its proposal to prohibit the use of direct emissions heating systems, such as 
those run on fossil fuel, in new buildings from 2024.  
S6W-10121 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government what type of heating systems it will 
require builders of new buildings to install in place of fossil fuel heating from 2024, should its 
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proposed ban on the use of direct emissions heating systems, such as those run on fossil fuel, in 
new-build properties be put in place; whether it will provide any data it has on how many of the 
existing workforce are already trained to fit any such systems; what action it is taking to retrain 
those already in the industry to fit any such systems; which courses it anticipates will be required 
at colleges to train new people to the industry to fit and maintain units required for any such 
systems; how many places on any such courses will (a) be made available and (b) require to be 
filled to meet workforce demand, and, if none of this information has yet been documented, what 
the reasons are for its position on this matter.  
S6W-10122 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government what data it has on the emissions 
savings that it anticipates will be achieved, should all new builds require to be fitted with 
alternatives to direct emissions heating systems, such as those run on fossil fuel, from 2024. 
S6W-10123 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government for what reason it chose 2024 as the 
proposed date from which the use of direct emissions heating systems, such as those run on fossil 
fuel, in new build properties will be banned, whether it has carried out research on any potential 
impact of such a date on builders who have pre-ordered such fossil-fuel heating, and, if so, what it 
anticipates that impact will be.   
S6W-10124 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government what its position is on whether the 
electricity grid will have capacity to cope with demand, should its proposed ban on the use of 
direct emissions heating systems in new-build properties from 2024 be put in place; whether it will 
provide any data it has on the matter; what action it is taking to ensure that the electricity grid 
would be able to meet that demand; what the cost of any such action is, and who it anticipates will 
bear any such cost.  
S6W-10125 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government what it anticipates the demand in 
Scotland for electricity will be from 2025, should its proposed ban on the use of direct emissions 
heating systems in new-build properties from 2024 be put in place, and in light of its projected 
increase in EV use; what its position is on whether renewables will consistently be able to meet 
that demand, and, if this is not the case, from what sources baseload will be generated. 
S6W-10126 Mark Ruskell: To ask the Scottish Government what proportion of (a) primary and (b) 
secondary schools offer girls the same access as boys to football through (i) physical education 
lessons and (ii) after-school clubs. 
S6W-10127 Miles Briggs: To ask the Scottish Government how much money it has provided to 
local authorities to tackle homelessness in the last 12 months, broken down by local authority. 
S6W-10128 Miles Briggs: To ask the Scottish Government how many affordable homes it has 
delivered in the last 12 months. 
S6W-10129 Miles Briggs: To ask the Scottish Government when it anticipates that its proposed 
Housing Bill will be published.  
S6W-10130 Claire Baker: To ask the Scottish Government how many people have used the 
Never Use Alone phone line, run by the charity We Are With You, since its launch, and, of those, 
how many have been referred to (a) drug treatment services and (b) other forms of support. 
S6W-10131 Claire Baker: To ask the Scottish Government what advice and support the Never 
Use Alone phone line, run by the charity We Are With You, provides. 
S6W-10132 Foysol Choudhury: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to 
question S6W-08620 by Jenny Gilruth on 6 June 2022, whether it will provide an update on when 
it anticipates that it will be able to review the data and analysis from the UK Department for 
Transport e-scooters trial programme in England. 
S6W-10133 Oliver Mundell: To ask the Scottish Government what steps are taken to ensure that 
standards are applied fairly across higher education when determining grades at undergraduate 
level. 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10122
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10123
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10124
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10125
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10126
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10127
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10128
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10129
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10130
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10131
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10132
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6W-10133


Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Questions | Ceistean 

 

 
48 Monday 8 August 2022 

 

S6W-10134 Oliver Mundell: To ask the Scottish Government what role it plays in monitoring 
whether best practice is followed by Scottish universities, regarding the moderation and cross-
marking of student assessments. 
S6W-10135 Jeremy Balfour: To ask the Scottish Government how much it has spent in the last 
12 months to increase access to advice services, including services which help maximise income, 
in order to tackle any poverty penalty and to improve wellbeing.  
S6W-10137 Jeremy Balfour: To ask the Scottish Government how much it has spent in the last 
12 months to provide (a) frontline and (b) second-tier advice and debt services.  
S6W-10138 Jeremy Balfour: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an update 
on progress in exploring systems of automatic payment for devolved social security benefits.  
S6W-10139 Jeremy Balfour: To ask the Scottish Government how much it has spent in the last 
12 months in order to tackle social isolation.  
S6W-10140 Jeremy Balfour: To ask the Scottish Government how much it has spent in the last 
12 months on funding third-sector organisations that help children and vulnerable groups.  
S6W-10141 Jeremy Balfour: To ask the Scottish Government how much it has spent in the last 
12 months to support the social enterprise sector.  
S6W-10142 Finlay Carson: To ask the Scottish Government whether it plans to respond to the 
UK Department for Environment, Food and Rural Affairs consultation Contractual Practice in the 
UK Pig Sector. 
S6W-10143 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what arrangements it is 
currently making to prepare to welcome any further refugees arriving from Ukraine in the coming 
weeks and months. 
S6W-10144 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what the dimensions of the 
bedrooms are on board the MS Victoria, how long it anticipates that Ukrainian refugees will be 
housed onboard the ship, and whether it has undertaken any checks to ascertain whether the (a) 
rooms and (b) ship as a whole are "habitable", following the definition as set out in the UN 
Committee on Economic, Social and Cultural Rights' General Comment No. 4: The Right to 
Adequate Housing (Art. 11 (1) of the Covenant) from 1991. 
S6W-10145 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government whether different households 
are sharing rooms on board the MS Victoria, and what measures are in place to ensure (a) 
infection control to limit any spread of COVID-19 and other viruses and (b) the safety and security 
of those living on board the ship.  
S6W-10146 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish government whether it has taken action to 
ensure timely access to COVID-19 vaccination for any Ukrainian refugee who wishes to be 
vaccinated.  
S6W-10147 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish government whether it plans to increase the 
support available to local authorities for (a) conducting disclosure checks and (b) vetting 
accommodation for Ukrainian refugees. 
S6W-10148 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government, regarding Ukrainian refugees, 
whether it plans to (a) create a transportation support fund to help them attend school and seek 
employment, (b) expand the Job Start Payment to help with the transition to employment and (c) 
include them in the free bus pass scheme. 
S6W-10149 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what (a) plans it has and (b) 
additional funding it has allocated to ensure that Ukrainian refugees living in rural areas are able to 
access affordable travel in order to attend, for example, medical appointments, religious services 
and job interviews.  
S6W-10150 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what arrangements it has 
made to ensure that Ukrainian refugees have access to local dental treatment and GP practices. 
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S6W-10151 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government whether Ukrainian refugees 
will have access to free NHS dental treatment. 
S6W-10153 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an 
update on its timescale for moving Ukrainian refugees from welcome hubs into longer-term 
accommodation.  
S6W-10154 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what (a) assessments it 
undertook and (b) preparations it made regarding the accommodation of refugees coming from 
Ukraine, prior to opening the Super Sponsor scheme.  
S6W-10155 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what (a) assessments it has 
undertaken and (b) preparations it has made to ensure adequate capacity for (i) Ukrainian children 
to be educated and (ii) Ukrainian-speaking translators to be made available in Scottish schools.  
S6W-10156 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what additional training it 
(a) has offered and (b) plans to offer teachers to help them provide any necessary educational and 
wellbeing support to pupils coming from Ukraine. 
S6W-10157 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government whether it can provide an 
update regarding the planned date for the reopening of the Super Sponsor scheme.  
S6W-10158 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government whether it has considered a 
community-based model for hosting refugees from Ukraine. 
S6W-10159 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what action it is taking to 
recruit Ukrainian speakers, who are already living in Scotland, to help welcome and communicate 
with refugees from Ukraine. 
S6W-10160 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an 
update on how many people, who signed up to the Homes for Ukraine scheme, are still waiting to 
be vetted.  
S6W-10161 Maurice Golden: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to the 
question S6W-09432 by Lorna Slater on 28 July 2022, for what reason the contract (a) with Biffa 
was not signed by March 2022 and (b) for IT services has still not been signed, and when it 
anticipates that the contract for IT services will be finalised. 
S6W-10162 Maurice Golden: To ask the Scottish Government whether it can provide a 
breakdown by local authority of the Deposit Return Scheme (DRS) return points rolled out by 
retailers. 
S6W-10163 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to 
question S6W-05100 by Humza Yousaf on 5 January 2022, whether it will publish the six-month 
progress reports for the nine research projects on long COVID.  
S6W-10164 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government for what reason the draft Bill regarding 
tenement maintenance will not be introduced until 2026, and whether it will ask the Scottish Law 
Commission to review its timetable.  
S6W-10165 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, whether it will prepare a medium-rise 
inventory, in light of the Building (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2022, which ban combustible 
cladding on buildings with any storey at a height of more than 11 metres above the ground.  
S6W-10166 Oliver Mundell: To ask the Scottish Government what consideration it has given to 
expanding free nursery provision at the age of two to children in receipt of Disability Living 
Allowance. 
S6W-10167 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government what support it can provide to the 
Clyde 2020 Research Advisory Group to facilitate the publication of an Ecosystem Enhancement 
Plan (EEP), to determine how any pressures on the Firth of Clyde may be managed to allow the 
natural recovery of fish stocks. 
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S6W-10168 Maurice Golden: To ask the Scottish Government whether it can provide a 
breakdown of funding provided to local authorities that has been ringfenced for net zero projects, 
in each of the last three years.   
S6W-10169 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09182 by Shona Robison on 24 June 2022, whether landlords are legally obliged to provide 
additional information when completing an amended section 11 notice form, where that requested 
information is not in the form prescribed in Schedule 1 of The Notice to Local Authorities 
(Scotland) Regulations 2008.   R 
S6W-10170 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09182 by Shona Robison on 24 June 2022, whether it will set out the part of the (a) 
Homelessness etc. (Scotland) Act 2003 and (b) Notice to Local Authorities (Scotland) Regulations 
2008 that (i) allows local authorities to amend and (ii) places a duty on local authorities to provide 
the section 11 notice form.  R 
S6W-10171 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09182 by Shona Robison on 24 June 2022, whether it can provide a breakdown of any local 
authorities that have amended the section 11 notice form of the Homelessness etc. (Scotland) Act 
2003. R 
S6W-10172 Dean Lockhart: To ask the Scottish Government, regarding the non-virtual National 
Public Energy Agency, whether it will provide (a) an update on when it will be set up and (b) 
details of (i) what services it will provide, (ii) how many staff it will employ and (iii) what its annual 
budget will be.  
S6W-10173 Dean Lockhart: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide (a) an update 
on when the virtual National Public Energy Agency will be established and (b) details of (i) how 
many people it will employ and (ii) what services it will provide. 
S6W-10175 Pauline McNeill: To ask the Scottish Government what the reasons are for its 
decision to end child fares on trains at 16 rather than 18 years old. 
S6W-10181 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09562 by Shona Robison on 13 July 2022, whether it will address the issue raised in the 
question regarding what action it is taking to improve public perception of the affordable housing 
supply programme, in light of Shelter Scotland's recent survey findings, conducted by YouGov, 
which reportedly found that 60% of adults in Scotland think that it is unlikely that the Scottish 
Government will deliver on its target of providing 110,000 affordable homes by 2032; what its 
response is to Shelter’s reported findings; whether it conducts its own polling and public 
perception research regarding the affordable housing supply programme, and (a) in what way and 
(b) how frequently it reviews the outcomes and deliverables of this programme. R 
S6W-10182 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09495 by Tom Arthur on 12 July 2022, (a) on what date and (b) by which minister the City of 
Edinburgh Council’s proposed designation of the Edinburgh short-term let control area was 
approved; whether a decision had been passed for approval to the responsible minister on or 
before 12 July 2022, the date on which the answer to question S6W-09495 was issued, and 
whether it will provide an advisory timetable for the determination of any other proposed control 
areas. 
S6W-10183 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government how many zero-carbon heating 
systems have been installed in (a) new and (b) existing homes in each year since 2016.  R 
S6W-10184 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government how many properties (a) built in each 
of the last five years and (b) under construction in 2022-23, under the affordable housing supply 
programme, (i) have zero carbon heating systems installed, (ii) received the greener subsidy and 
(iii) attained (A) bronze (B) bronze active (C) silver (D) silver active (E) gold or (F) platinum levels 
of sustainability.  R 
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S6W-10185 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government how many heating installations under 
the (a) Warmer Homes Scotland (b) area-based schemes and (c) Home Energy Scotland Loans 
and Cashback schemes have been (a) carbon producing and (b) zero carbon, in each year of 
operation of the respective schemes.  R 
S6W-10186 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government how many heating and renewable 
installations under the (a) Warmer Homes Scotland (b) area-based schemes and (c) Home Energy 
Scotland Loans and Cashback schemes were (i) gas boilers (ii) electric storage heaters (iii) air 
source heat pumps (iv) oil boilers (v) solar PV (vi) LPG boilers (vii) biomass boilers (viii) domestic 
battery storage units, (ix) district heating connections and (x) solar thermal systems, in each year 
of operation of the respective schemes.  R 
S6W-10187 Jamie Halcro Johnston: To ask the Scottish Government when it plans to make 
regulations under section 4 of the Civil Partnership (Scotland) Act 2020 to enable marriages to 
become civil partnerships.   
S6W-10188 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09619 by Shona Robison on 19 July 2022, whether it will (a) compile and (b) require local 
authorities to compile this information to establish (i) the progress being made to remediate 
buildings, and (b) how much remediation is being conducted (A) with the support of the Scottish 
Government and (B) privately. 
S6W-10189 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09248 by Shona Robison on 20 July 2022, whether it will prioritise the assessment of the 29 
buildings in the event of a limited supply of surveyors and fire engineer contractors, and if so, what 
the process will be for carrying out any such prioritisation.   
S6W-10190 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to S6W-09248 
by Shona Robison on 20 July 2022, how many buildings (a) have provided consent and details (i) 
by and (ii) on or since 20 July 2022 and (b) it requires to provide consent and detail before it will 
move to the contracting process; what the estimated timescales are for the contracting process; 
and, when contracting, what it plans to propose as a lead time for surveyors and fire engineers to 
be on site.  
S6W-10191 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answers to questions 
S6W-09248 and S6W-09249 by Shona Robison on 20 July 2022, how many of the 15 buildings 
using its grant-based approach (a) have (i) been approached to take up and (ii) requested directly 
commissioned assessments, (b) successfully procured their own surveyors and fire engineers and 
(c) have an assessment underway. 
S6W-10192 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09248 by Shona Robison on 20 July 2022, what pre-contracting activity it has undertaken to 
establish (a) how many contractors will be required to deliver assessments for all 29 buildings, (b) 
the (i) availability and (ii) capacity of surveyors and fire engineers to carry out the contract, and, in 
the event that any such pre-contracting assessments have identified an insufficient supply of 
contractors, what it anticipates the likely training needs will be to meet any identified requirements. 
S6W-10193 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government how the single building assessment is 
designed to take account of any risk of electric vehicle fires, whether any specific assessment 
protocols are included in the assessment to respond to any such risks and, if this is the case, 
whether it will provide the details of any such protocols.  
S6W-10194 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-08297 by Shona Robison on 12 May 2022, whether it will provide an update on how many 
properties are at each stage of assessment, how many single building assessments have been 
supplied to building owners, and what the average amount of time is that each phase has taken. 
S6W-10197 Liam McArthur: To ask the Scottish Government how many new connections of 
superfast broadband have been delivered to properties in the North Scotland Lot, as part of the 
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Reaching 100 Programme, in each month from 1 January to 31 July 2022, broken down by local 
authority area. R 
S6W-10198 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09252 by Shona Robison on 21 July 22, what the expenditure has been on the (a) Cladding 
Remediation Unit and (b) Single Building Assessment in each year since 2017, broken down by 
type of spending. 
S6W-10199 Mark Griffin: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-09252 by Shona Robison on 21 July 2022, whether these sums of money are included in the 
Single Building Assessment programme: spending information, which was released on 12 May 
2022, and how much has been spent on contractors (a) prior to July 2021 and (b) in July and 
August 2022.
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Progress of Legislation 

                                                                                                                                                                 

A list of all Bills in progress can be accessed via the Scottish Parliament website at: 

https://www.parliament.scot/bills-and-laws/bills 
 
For each Bill, the date of the next (or most recent) event in the Bill’s passage is given. Other 
relevant information, e.g. about lodging amendments, is given in italics.  

As soon as a Public Bill (i.e. a Government, Committee or Member’s Bill) has completed Stage 1, 
amendments for consideration at Stage 2 may be lodged; and as soon as Stage 2 is completed, 
amendments for Stage 3 consideration may be lodged. The last lodging day for amendments at 
Stage 2 is four sitting days before the meeting at which those amendments will be considered (e.g. 
Wednesday for a meeting on Tuesday); at Stage 3 it is five days before. Amendments may be 
lodged until 4.30 pm on any sitting day, except on the last lodging day for each Stage, when the 
deadline is 12 noon.  
 
A Hybrid Bill is subject to the same rules except in the case of Stage 2 where amendments for 
consideration may be lodged no earlier than the completion of any consideration of evidence at 
Stage 2. 

Amendments to Private Bills are subject to different deadlines. These are set out in Rule 9A.12 of 
Standing Orders. 
 
Members are advised to lodge amendments in good time before the beginning of a Stage and as 
early as possible during the day.  
 
(G) = Government Bill; (M) = Member’s Bill; (C) = Committee Bill; (P) = Private Bill; (H) = Hybrid 
Bill. 
 
Bail and Release from Custody (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (lead committee (Criminal Justice)), 29 June 2022 
 
Coronavirus (Recovery and Reform) (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Passed, 28 June 2022 

 
Disabled Children and Young People (Transitions to Adulthood) (Scotland) Bill (M) 
Introduced, 20 April 2022 

Lead committee – Education, Children and Young People 
 
European Charter of Local Self-Government (Incorporation) (Scotland) Bill (M) 
Passed, 23 March 2021 

Following a reference under section 33 of the Scotland Act 1998 by the Attorney General and 
the Advocate General for Scotland, the Supreme Court has ruled that some provisions of the 
Bill are outwith the legislative competence of the Scottish Parliament. The Bill cannot be 
submitted for Royal Assent in its unamended form. 

 
Fireworks and Pyrotechnic Articles (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Passed, 29 June 2022 
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Gender Recognition Reform (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (evidence, lead committee (Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice)), 28 June 2022 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (29th Report, 2022) 
 

Hunting with Dogs (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (evidence, lead committee (Rural Affairs, Islands and Natural Environment)), 29 June 
2022 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (19th Report, 2022) 
 
Moveable Transactions (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (lead committee (Delegated Powers and Law Reform)), 21 June 2022 
 
National Care Service (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (lead committee (Health, Social Care and Sport Committee)), 28 June 2022 
 
United Nations Convention on the Rights of the Child (Incorporation) (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Passed, 16 March 2021 

Following a reference under section 33 of the Scotland Act 1998 by the Attorney General and 
the Advocate General for Scotland, the Supreme Court has ruled that some provisions of the 
Bill are outwith the legislative competence of the Scottish Parliament. The Bill cannot be 
submitted for Royal Assent in its unamended form. 

 
 

Legislative Consent Memorandums  
 
A list of all Legislative Consent Memorandums lodged with the Scottish Parliament can be 
accessed via the website at: 
 
https://www.parliament.scot/bills-and-laws/bills/legislative-consent-memorandums 

 

Animal Welfare (Kept Animals) Bill LCM-S6-1 

Lodged on 22 June 2021 

Meeting of the Parliament, 11 January 2022 

Report – Rural Affairs, Islands and Natural Environment Committee (4th Report, 2021) 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (14th Report, 2021) 

 
High Speed Rail (Crewe - Manchester) Bill LCM-S6-15 
Lodged on 7 February 2022 
Lead committee (Net Zero, Energy and Transport), 28 June 2022 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (27th Report 2022) 
 

Levelling-up and Regeneration Bill LCM-S6-23 
Lodged on 27 July 2022 
 

Online Safety Bill LCM-S6-18 

Lodged on 31 March 2022 

Report – Criminal Justice Committee (7th Report 2022) 
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Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (33rd Report 2022) 
 

Procurement Bill LCM-S6-20 

Lodged on 25 May 2022 

 

Social Security (Special Rules for End of Life) Bill LCM-S6-19 

Lodged on 25 May 2022 

Meeting of the Parliament, 29 June 2022 

 

Trade (Australia and New Zealand) Bill LCM-S6-21 
Lodged on 13 June 2022 

                             Subordinate Legislation (date of laying) (lead committee) 
 
Made affirmative instruments 
 
Subject to approval by 1 October  
 
Scottish Landfill Tax (Prescribed Landfill Site Activities) Amendment Order 2022 (SSI 2022/233) (1 
July 2022) (Finance and Public Administration Committee) 
 
Affirmative instruments 
 
Subject to approval by 13 September  
 
Scottish Tribunals (Listed Tribunals) Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/Draft) (1 June 2022) (Equalities, 
Human Rights and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to approval by 18 September  
 
Health (Tobacco, Nicotine etc. and Care) (Scotland) Act 2016 (Supplementary Provision) 
Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/Draft) (6 June 2022) (Health, Social Care and Sport Committee) 
 
Subject to approval by 21 September  
 
Age of Criminal Responsibility (Reports on Use of Places of Safety) (Scotland) Regulations 2022 
(SSI 2022/Draft) (9 June 2022) (Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to approval by 4 October  
  
Advice and Assistance (Summary Criminal Proceedings) (Miscellaneous Amendment) (Scotland) 
Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/Draft) (22 June 2022) (Criminal Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to approval by 26 October  
 
Consumer Scotland (Transfer of Functions) Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/Draft) (28 June 2022) 
(Economy and Fair Work Committee) 
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Negative instruments 
 
Subject to annulment 7 September 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 5 September 2022 
 
Justice of the Peace Court Fees (Scotland) Order 2022 (SSI 2022/179) (26 May 2022) (Equalities, 
Human Rights and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Sheriff Court Fees Order 2022 (SSI 2022/181) (26 May 2022) (Equalities, Human Rights and Civil 
Justice Committee) 
 
High Court of Justiciary Fees Order 2022 (SSI 2022/182) (26 May 2022) (Equalities, Human 
Rights and Civil Justice Committee 
 
Sheriff Appeal Court Fees Order 2022 (SSI 2022/183) (26 May 2022) (Equalities, Human Rights 
and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Adults with Incapacity (Public Guardian’s Fees) (Scotland) Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/184) (26 
May 2022) (Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Court of Session etc. Fees Order 2022 (SSI 2022/185) (26 May 2022) (Equalities, Human Rights 
and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 11 September 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 5 September 2022  
 
Seed (Fees) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/186) (30 May 2022) (Rural 
Affairs, Islands and Natural Environment Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 13 September 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 12 September 2022  
 
Town and Country Planning (Fees for Applications) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2022 (SSI 
2022/190) (1 June 2022) (Local Government, Housing and Planning Committee) 
 
Coronavirus (Scotland) (No. 2) Act 2020 (Suspension: Termination of Student Residential 
Tenancy) Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/192) (1 June 2022) (COVID-19 Recovery Committee) 
 
Meat Preparations (Import Conditions) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/193) 
(1 June 2022) (Rural Affairs, Islands and Natural Environment Committee) 
 
Prisons and Young Offenders Institutions (Scotland) Amendment Rules 2022 (SSI 2022/194) 
(1 June 2022) (Criminal Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 21 September 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 19 September 2022  
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Gender Recognition (Marriage and Civil Partnership Registration) (Scotland) Amendment 
Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/201) (9 June 2022) (Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice 
Committee) 
 
Gender Recognition (Marriage and Civil Partnership Registration) (Modification) (Scotland) 
Amendment Order 2022 (SSI 2022/202) (9 June 2022) (Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice 
Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 22 September 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 19 September 2022 
 
Vegetable Plant Material and Fruit Plant and Propagating Material (EU Exit) (Scotland) 
(Amendment) Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/203) (10 June 2022) (Rural Affairs, Islands and Natural 
Environment Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 28 September 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 26 September 2022 
 
Rural Support (Simplification and Improvement) (Scotland) Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/206) (16 
June 2022) (Rural Affairs, Islands and Natural Environment Committee) 
 
Public Health etc. (Scotland) Act 2008 (Notifiable Diseases and Notifiable Organisms) Amendment 
Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/212)(16 June 2022) (Health, Social Care and Sport Committee) 
 
National Health Service (Charges to Overseas Visitors) (Scotland) Amendment (No. 2) 
Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/213) (16 June 2022) (Health, Social Care and Sport Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 29 September 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 26 September 
 
Building (Scotland) Amendment (Amendment) Regulations 2022 (SSI 2022/209) (17 June 2022) 
(Local Government, Housing and Planning Committee) 
 
Offensive Weapons Act 2019 (Prescribed Documents) (Scotland) (No. 2) Order 2022 (SSI 
2022/210) (17 June 2022) (Criminal Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 3 October 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 26 September 
 
Sheriff Court Fees Amendment Order 2022 (SSI 2022/214) (21 June 2022) (Equalities, Human 
Rights and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 5 October 2022 
Lead Committee report due by 3 October  
 
General Pharmaceutical Council (Amendment) Rules Order of Council 2022 (SI 2022/697) (23 
June 2022) (Health, Social Care and Sport Committee) 
 
Documents subject to approval 
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Lead Committee report due by 30 October 2022 
Scottish Social Housing Charter: November 2022 (SG/2022/146) (29 July 2022) (Local 
Government, Housing and Planning Committee) 
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New Documents 

Committee Reports 

The following report was published on 2 August 2022— 

Education, Children and Young People Committee, 8th Report, 2022 (Session 6): Scottish 
Attainment Challenge Inquiry (SP Paper 219) 

For further information on accessing committee reports, please contact the relevant clerk or 
webpage (see end of Bulletin for contact details or access general committee webpage) 

Other Documents 

The following document was laid before the Parliament on 2 August 2022 and is not subject to 
parliamentary procedure— 
 
HMICS Assurance Review of Police Scotland Strategic Workforce Planning HMICS/2022/02 
laid under section 79(3) of the Police and Fire Reform (Scotland) Act 2012 
 
The following document was laid before the Parliament on 5 August 2022 and is not subject to 
parliamentary procedure— 
 
Scottish Civil Justice Council Annual Report and Programme SCJC/2022/01 laid under 
section 5(4) of the Scottish Civil Justice Council and Criminal Legal Assistance Act 2013 
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Contacts for Further Information 

All telephone numbers 0131 348 XXXX 
Web site: https://www.parliament.scot 

General Enquiries 5000 

Chamber Desk (Motions and Questions) 5199 

Parliamentary Business Team (Chamber, Parliamentary Bureau) 5187 

Legislation Team 5277 

Non-Government Bills Unit (NGBU) 6124 

 
Committee web sites at: 
https://www.parliament.scot/chamber-and-committees/committees 

  

 
MSP Details 
https://www.parliament.scot/msps/current-and-previous-msps

https://www.parliament.scot/
https://www.parliament.scot/chamber-and-committees/committees
https://www.parliament.scot/msps/current-and-previous-msps
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